
Draft Legislation: This is a draft item of legislation. This draft has since been made as a Scottish
Statutory Instrument: The Civil Legal Aid (Financial Conditions) (Scotland) Regulations 2008 No. 138

DRAFT SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2008 No.

LEGAL AID AND ADVICE

The Civil Legal Aid (Financial
Conditions) (Scotland) Regulations 2008

Made       -      -      -      - 2008

Coming into force 7th April 2008

THE CIVIL LEGAL AID (FINANCIAL
CONDITIONS) (SCOTLAND) REGULATIONS 2008

1. Citation, commencement and interpretation  
2. Application  
3. Amendment of the Legal Aid (Scotland) Act 1986  
4. In section 15(2)(a) of the Act for “£11,402” substitute “£11,847”....  
5. In section 17(2)(a) of the Act for “£3,085” substitute “£3,156”....  
6. In section 17(2)(b) of the Act for “£6,879” substitute “£7,147”....  
7. Revocation  

  Signature  
  Explanatory Note  


