
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk editorial
team to Finance Act 2024. Any changes that have already been made by the team appear in the content

and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

Finance Act 2024
2024 CHAPTER 3

PART 2

OTHER TAXES

Environmental taxes

29 Rates of landfill tax

(1) Section 42 of FA 1996 (amount of landfill tax) is amended as follows.

(2) In subsection (1)(a) (standard rate), for “£102.10” substitute “£103.70”.

(3) In subsection (2) (reduced rate for certain disposals), in the words after paragraph (b)
—

(a) for “£102.10” substitute “£103.70”, and
(b) for “£3.25” substitute “£3.30”.

(4) The amendments made by this section have effect in relation to disposals made (or
treated as made) on or after 1 April 2024.

30 Rate of aggregates levy

(1) In section 16(4) of FA 2001 (rate of aggregates levy), for “£2” substitute “£2.03”.

(2) The amendment made by this section has effect in relation to aggregate subjected to
commercial exploitation on or after 1 April 2024.

31 Rate of plastic packaging tax

(1) In section 45(1) of FA 2021 (rate of plastic packaging tax), for “£210.82” substitute
“£217.85”.

(2) The amendment made by this section has effect in relation to packaging components
produced in, or imported into, the United Kingdom on or after 1 April 2024.



2 Finance Act 2024 (c. 3)
Document Generated: 2024-05-11

Changes to legislation: 
There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk editorial team to Finance
Act 2024. Any changes that have already been made by the team appear in the content and are
referenced with annotations.
View outstanding changes

Changes and effects yet to be applied to the whole Act associated Parts and Chapters:
Whole provisions yet to be inserted into this Act (including any effects on those
provisions):
– Sch. 9 para. 132(1) Sch. 9 para. 132 renumbered as Sch. 9 para. 132(1) by S.I.

2024/356 reg. 4(23)(a)
– Sch. 9 para. 125(1)(c) and word inserted by S.I. 2024/356 reg. 4(3)(b)
– Sch. 9 para. 125(3A) inserted by S.I. 2024/356 reg. 4(6)
– Sch. 9 para. 126(1)(c) inserted by S.I. 2024/356 reg. 4(9)(c)
– Sch. 9 para. 126(3A) inserted by S.I. 2024/356 reg. 4(10)
– Sch. 9 para. 127A and cross-heading inserted by S.I. 2024/356 reg. 4(12)
– Sch. 9 para. 128(6)(a)(zi) inserted by S.I. 2024/356 reg. 4(13)
– Sch. 9 para. 129(1)(c)(d) inserted by S.I. 2024/356 reg. 4(15)(b)
– Sch. 9 para. 129(2)(c) and word inserted by S.I. 2024/356 reg. 4(16)(b)
– Sch. 9 para. 130A and cross-heading inserted by S.I. 2024/356 reg. 4(21)
– Sch. 9 para. 132(2)-(5) inserted by S.I. 2024/356 reg. 4(23)(c)
– Sch. 9 para. 132A and cross-heading inserted by S.I. 2024/356 reg. 4(24)
– Sch. 9 para. 132(1) words inserted by S.I. 2024/356 reg. 4(23)(b)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356/regulation/4/23/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356/regulation/4/3/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356/regulation/4/6
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356/regulation/4/9/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356/regulation/4/10
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356/regulation/4/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356/regulation/4/13
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356/regulation/4/15/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356/regulation/4/16/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356/regulation/4/21
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356/regulation/4/23/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356/regulation/4/24
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/356/regulation/4/23/b

