STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2015 No. 1369
LEGAL AID AND ADVICE, ENGLAND AND WALES

The Criminal Legal Aid (Remuneration etc.) (Amendment)
Regulations 2015

Made - - - - 9th June 2015
Laid before Parliament 10th June 2015

Coming into force in accordance with regulation 1

The Lord Chancellor makes these Regulations(a) in exercise of the powers conferred by sections
2(3), 13(4) and (5), 15(9), 18(3) and (4), 21(2) and 41(1) to (3) of the Legal Aid, Sentencing and
Punishment of Offenders Act 2012(b).

PART 1
GENERAL

Citation, commencement and interpretation
1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Criminal Legal Aid (Remuneration etc.)
(Amendment) Regulations 2015.
(2) These Regulations come into force for the purposes of—
(a) Part2 on 1stJuly 2015, and
(b) Part 3 on 11th January 2016.

(3) In these Regulations, “the Criminal Remuneration Regulations” means the Criminal Legal
Aid (Remuneration) Regulations 2013(c).

Transitional provisions

2.—(1) The amendments made by Part 2 of these Regulations apply to matters in which a
relevant determination is made on or after 1stJuly 2015.

(2) The amendments made by Part 3 of these Regulations apply to matters in which a relevant
determination is made on or after 11th January 2016.

(3) In this regulation a “relevant determination” means a determination made under section 13
(advice and assistance for individuals in custody), section 15 (advice and assistance for criminal
proceedings) or section 16 (representation for criminal proceedings) of the Legal Aid, Sentencing
and Punishment of Offenders Act 2012.

(a) Section 42(1) of the Legal Aid, Sentencing and Punishment of Offenders Act 2012 (c. 10) provides that in Part 1 of that Act
“regulations” means regulations made by the Lord Chancellor.

(b) 2012 c. 10.

(¢) S.1.2013/435.



PART 2
AMENDMENTS COMING INTO FORCE ON 1ST JULY 2015

Amendments to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations

3.—(1) The Criminal Remuneration Regulations are amended as follows.

(2) Schedule 2 (litigators’ graduated fee scheme) is amended as set out in Schedule 1 to these
Regulations.

(3) Schedule 3 (proceedings in the Court of Appeal) is amended as set out in Schedule 2 to these
Regulations.

(4) Schedule 4 (rates payable for the claims specified in regulation 8) is amended as set out in
Schedule 3 to these Regulations.

PART 3
AMENDMENTS COMING INTO FORCE ON 11TH JANUARY 2016

Amendments to the Criminal Legal Aid (General) Regulations 2013

4.—(1) The Criminal Legal Aid (General) Regulations 2013(a) are amended as follows.
(2) In regulation 2(b) (interpretation)—
(a) 1in the appropriate place, insert—

13113

relevant contract” means whichever of the 2015 Duty Provider Crime Contract or the
2015 Own Client Crime Contract governs the provision of advice and assistance made
available under sections 13 or 15 of the Act, for which remuneration is claimed;”;

(b) in the definition of “Unit of Work”, for “1.5 of Part A of the Specification to the 2010
Standard Crime Contract” substitute “1.1 of the Standard Terms to the relevant contract”,
and

(c) for the definition of “2010 Standard Crime Contract” substitute—

““2015 Duty Provider Crime Contract” and “2015 Own Client Crime Contract” mean
the contracts so named between the Lord Chancellor and a provider of advice and
assistance or representation made available under sections 13, 15 or 16 of the Act.”.

(3) In each of the following, for “2010 Standard Crime Contract” substitute “relevant
contract’—

(a) regulation 8(b) (applications);

(b) regulation 11(3) (general);

(c) regulation 14 (applications), in both places it occurs;
(d) regulation 15(1)(b) (determinations);

(e) regulation 16(e)(ii) (withdrawal), and

(f) regulation 17(b) (appeal).

Amendments to the Civil Legal Aid (Remuneration) Regulations 2013

5.—(1) The Civil Legal Aid (Remuneration) Regulations 2013(c) are amended as follows.
(2) In regulation 2(1)(d) (interpretation)—

(a) S.1.2013/9.

(b) Amended by S.I. 2013/2790.

(¢) S.1.2013/422.

(d) Amended by S.I. 2014/7, 2014/586, 2014/1389, 2014/1824 and 2015/325.



(a) for the definition of “the relevant contract” substitute—

11173

the relevant contract” means whichever of the 2010 Standard Civil Contract, the 2013
Standard Civil Contract, the 2013 Individual Case Contract (Civil), the 2014 Standard
Civil Contract, the 2014 Standard Civil Contract (Welfare Benefits), the 2015 Duty
Provider Crime Contract, the 2015 Own Client Crime Contract or the 2015 Standard
Civil Contract governs the provision of civil legal services for which remuneration is
claimed; and”, and

(b) for the entry beginning “the 2010 Standard Civil Contract” substitute—

““the 2010 Standard Civil Contract”, “the 2013 Standard Civil Contract”, “the 2013
Individual Case Contract (Civil)”, “the 2013 Individual Case Contract (High Cost
Civil)?, “the 2014 Standard Civil Contract”, “the 2014 Standard Civil Contract
(Welfare Benefits)”, “the 2015 Duty Provider Crime Contract”, “the 2015 Own Client
Crime Contract” and “the 2015 Standard Civil Contract” mean the contracts so named
between the Lord Chancellor and a provider of civil legal services under Part 1 of the
Act (legal aid).”.

(3) In regulation 5A(3)(a) (interpretation)—
(a) omit sub-paragraph (a), and
(b) for sub-paragraph (j) substitute—

“() “relevant contract” includes the 2013 Individual Case Contract (High Cost Civil)
and the 2013 CLA Contract;”.

Amendments to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations

6.—(1) The Criminal Remuneration Regulations are amended as follows.
(2) In the Table of Contents, in the entry for Schedule 2—
(a) in the heading of Schedule 2 omit “Graduated”, and

(b) at the appropriate place, insert “Part 1A Fixed Fees for Guilty Pleas, Cracked Trials and
Trials”.

(3) In regulation 8 (claims for fees for certain categories of work to which the Standard Crime
Contract applies)—

(a) in the heading, omit “to which the Standard Crime Contract applies”;

(b) in paragraph (2)(a), for “2010 Standard Crime Contract” substitute “relevant contract”,
and

(c) for paragraph (3), substitute—
“(3) In this regulation and in Schedule 4—

“relevant contract” means whichever of the 2015 Duty Provider Crime Contract or the
2015 Own Client Crime Contract governs the provision of advice and assistance or
representation made available under sections 13, 15 or 16 of the Act, for which
remuneration is claimed, and

“2015 Duty Provider Crime Contract” and “2015 Own Client Crime Contract” mean
the contracts so named between the Lord Chancellor and a provider of advice and
assistance or representation made available under sections 13, 15 or 16 of the Act.”.

(4) In regulation 17A(b) (interim payment of litigators’ fees)—
(a) paragraphs (11) to (13) are amended as set out in Schedule 4 to these Regulations;
(b) in paragraph (14)—

(a) Inserted by S.I. 2015/898. S.I. 2014/607 first inserted regulation 5A but was quashed by the High Court by order dated 19th
March 2015 in R (on the application of Ben Hoare Bell Solicitors and Others) v Lord Chancellor [2015] EWHC 523
(Admin).

(b) Inserted by S.I. 2014/2422.



(©)

(1) for “paragraph (13)(a)(i)” substitute “paragraph (13)(b)(i)”;
(ii) for “paragraph 5(2)”, in both instances, substitute “paragraph 5, and

(iii) at the end of sub-paragraphs (a) and (b) insert “as appropriate to the offence with
which the assisted person is charged and the number of pages of prosecution
evidence served on the court™;

in paragraph (19), for ““PPE Cut-off” has” substitute ““‘cracked trial”, “guilty plea” and
“PPE Cut-off” have”, and

(d) after paragraph (19), insert—

“(20) For the purpose of this regulation, the number of pages of prosecution evidence
served on the court must be determined in accordance with paragraph 1(3) to (5) of
Schedule 2.”.

(5) At the end of regulation 21(4)(d)(a) (hardship payments) insert “, where appropriate”.

(6) In regulation 28(1)(c)(i)(b) (redetermination of fees by appropriate officer), for “calculation”
substitute “determination”.

(7) In Schedule 2—

(a)
(b)

(©
(d)
(e)
()

€9)

(h)

®

in the heading of the Schedule omit “Graduated”;

in paragraph 1(1), in the definition of “PPE Cut-off’—
(i) omit “minimum’’;

(ii) for “calculating” substitute “determining”’;

(iii) for “tables” substitute “table”, and

(iv) omit “(1) and (2)”;

after paragraph 3 (class of offences) insert Part 1A as set out in Schedule 5 to these
Regulations;

in paragraph 4(2)(c) (scope), after “in all cases” insert “in which the number of pages of
prosecution evidence served on the court exceeds 500”;

for paragraph 5 (pages of prosecution evidence) substitute paragraph 5 as set out in
Schedule 6 to these Regulations;

omit paragraph 6(d) (cracked trial or guilty plea where the number of pages of
prosecution evidence is less than or equal to the PPE Cut-off);

in the each of the following paragraphs, for “paragraph 5(2)” substitute “paragraph 5"—

(1) 7(1)(e) (trial where the number of pages of prosecution evidence is less than or equal
to the PPE Cut-off);

(i) 9(1)(f) (trials where the number of pages of prosecution evidence exceeds the PPE
Cut-off);

(iii) 12(3)(b) and (d) (defendant uplifts), and
(iv) 13(7)(b) and (d) (retrials and transfers);

in the heading of paragraph 8(g) (cracked trials and guilty pleas where the number of
pages of prosecution evidence exceeds the PPE Cut-off) omit the words following “guilty
pleas”;

in paragraph 8(1)—

(i) for “Where in” substitute “In”, and

(a)
(b)
(c)
@
(e)
®)
(€:9)

Amended by S.1. 2014/2422 and 2015/882.
Amended by S.I. 2015/882.

Sub

stituted by S.I. 2014/2422.

Amended by S.I. 2014/415.
Amended by S.I. 2014/415.
Amended by S.I. 2014/415.
Amended by S.I. 2014/415.



(i1) omit the words from “the number” to “‘charged”;

() for the tables following paragraph 8(2), including the headings to the tables, substitute the
text as set out in Schedule 7 to these Regulations;

(k) for the table following paragraph 9(2), including the heading to the table, substitute the
text as set out in Schedule 8 to these Regulations;

() at the end of the heading of Part 3 (fixed fee for guilty pleas and cracked trials) insert “in
Elected Cases”;

(m) in paragraph 12—
(1) in sub-paragraph (1), after “litigator” insert “under Part 2”;
(i1) omit sub-paragraph (3)(a);
(iii) in sub-paragraph (3)(c), omit the words from “where” to “paragraph 5(1)”, and
(iv) in sub-paragraph (4), for “(a)” substitute “(b)”;
(n) in paragraph 13(7)—
(i) for paragraph (a) substitute—

“(a) in a case to which Part 1A applies, the fixed fee determined in accordance with
paragraph 3AA;”;

(ii) in paragraph (c), omit the words from “where” to “paragraph 5(1),”;

(iii) in paragraphs (b) and (d), after “in a trial” insert “in a case to which Part 2 applies,”,
and

(iv) in the heading of the fourth column in the table following sub-paragraph (12), after
“Claim period” insert “(where Part 2 applies)”;

(o) in paragraph 14(2) (general provisions), before “Part 2”, in both instances, insert “Part 1A

99,

or’;

(p) in paragraph 20(1) (fees for special preparation), after “Crown Court” insert “to which
Part 2 applies”;

(q) in paragraph 21 (discontinuance or dismissal of sent or transferred proceedings), for sub-
paragraphs (2) to (6) substitute sub-paragraphs (2) to (5) as set out in Schedule 9 to these
Regulations;

(r) in paragraph 22 (defendant uplifts)—
(i) for sub-paragraph (1) substitute—

“(1) A defendant uplift is payable where a litigator represents more than one assisted
person in the circumstances referred to in—

(a) paragraph 21(2), or

(b) paragraph 21(3), where the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the
court exceeds 500.”;

(ii) in sub-paragraph (3)—
(aa) atthe end of paragraph (a), insert “or”;
(bb) for paragraph (b) substitute—

“(b) in the circumstances referred to in paragraph 21(3), the initial fee specified in
paragraph 8, as appropriate to the circumstances set out in paragraph 21(4)(b).”,
and

(cc) omit paragraph (c), and
(iii) omit sub-paragraph (4);

(s) for paragraph 23(2) (warrant for arrest), substitute paragraph 23(2) as set out in Schedule
10 to these Regulations, and

(t) for paragraph 25 (assisted person unfit to plead or stand trial), substitute paragraph 25 as
set out in Schedule 11 to these Regulations.



(8) In Schedule 4—

(a) except in paragraphs 2(1)(a) (work conducted at the Police Station: Police Station advice
and assistance) and 6(2)(b)(b) (own client work), for “National”, wherever it appears,
substitute “Outside London”;

(b) in paragraph 1(c) (interpretation of this Schedule), for “2010 Standard Crime Contract”
substitute “relevant contract’;

(c) in paragraph 2—
(1) in sub-paragraph (1)(b), omit “(“National”)”;
(ii) for sub-paragraph (3), substitute—
“(3) The hourly rates for Police Station attendance for the purposes of—

(a) recording time and determining whether the Escape Fee Case Threshold has been
reached, and

(b) payment of remuneration in cases in which the Escape Fee Case Threshold has
been reached,

are specified in the table following this sub-paragraph as appropriate to the place of
attendance.”;

(iii) in the table following sub-paragraph (3), for “Solicitor”, wherever it appears,
substitute “Provider”, and

(iv) for sub-paragraph (4) to the end of paragraph 2 substitute sub-paragraphs (4) to (7)
as set out in Schedule 12 to these Regulations;

(d) in paragraph 3(d) (work conducted outside the Police Station)—
(1) for “Solicitor”, wherever it appears, substitute “Provider”, and

(ii) in sub-paragraph (1) and the heading of the table following sub-paragraph (1), omit
“free standing”;

(e) in paragraph 4(e) (Advice and Assistance and Advocacy Assistance by a court Duty
Solicitor and Advocacy Assistance at the Virtual Court), including the heading, for
“Solicitor”, wherever it appears, substitute “Lawyer”;

(f) in paragraph 5(f) (representation in the magistrates’ court)—
(i) before sub-paragraph (1), insert—
“(A1) This paragraph does not apply where paragraph SA applies.”;
(i1) in sub-paragraph (1), omit “(except where paragraph SA applies)”;
(iii) in sub-paragraph (1)(a), omit “Lower or Higher”;
(iv) for sub-paragraph (1)(b) substitute—

“(b) the payment of remuneration in cases in which the Standard Fee Limit has been
reached,”;

(v) in the table following sub-paragraph (1), omit the entry beginning “Travelling and
waiting hourly rate”, and

(vi) for sub-paragraph (2) and the table following it substitute sub-paragraphs (2) to (2B)
as set out in Schedule 13 to these Regulations, and

(g) in paragraph 6—

(1) for the heading substitute “Work undertaken prior to a determination that an
individual is not eligible for criminal legal aid”;

(a)
(b)
()
)
(e)
®)

Amended by S.I. 2014/415.
Amended by S.1. 2014/415.
Amended by S.I. 2015/325.
Amended by S.I. 2014/415.
Amended by S.I. 2014/415.
Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/325.



(i1) in sub-paragraph (2)(b), omit “(“National”)”;

(iii) omit the heading before the table following sub-paragraph (4), and

(iv) in the table—
(aa) omit “(only applicable where the Undesignated Area fees apply)”, and
(bb) for “N/A” substitute “21.70”.

Amendments to the Criminal Legal Aid (Financial Resources) Regulations 2013

7.In regulation 5(2) (interpretation) of the Criminal Legal Aid (Financial Resources)
Regulations 2013(a)—

(a) for the definition of “2010 Standard Crime Contract” substitute—

““2015 Duty Provider Crime Contract” and “2015 Own Client Crime Contract” mean
the contracts so named between the Lord Chancellor and a provider of advice and
assistance or representation made available under sections 13, 15 or 16 of the Act;”;

(b) omit the definition of “duty solicitor”;

(c) in the definition of “relevant advice and assistance”, in sub-paragraph (b), for the words
from “by a duty solicitor” to the end of sub-paragraph (b) substitute “in accordance with
the relevant contract”, and

(d) at the appropriate place, insert—

““relevant contract” means whichever of the 2015 Duty Provider Crime Contract or the
2015 Own Client Crime Contract governs the provision of advice and assistance made
available under section 13 of the Act, for which remuneration is claimed;”.

Shailesh Vara
Parliamentary Under Secretary of State
Oth June 2015 Ministry of Justice

(a) S.I. 2013/471, to which there are amendments not relevant to these Regulations.



SCHEDULE 1 Regulation 3(2)

Amendments to Schedule 2 to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations

1. For the table following paragraph 6(2) (basic fees for cracked trials and guilty pleas)
substitute the following—

“Class of Offence
Type of A B C D E F G H I J K
case
Cracked
trial 817. 641. 474. 776. 210. 202. 202. 214. 229. 817. 699.
84 15 52 94 69 72 72 28 35 84 66

Guilty
plea 615. 502. 400. 584. 166. 177. 177. 172. 157. 615. 579.
14 79 44 38 99 04 04 66 86 14 39”.

2. In paragraph 7—
(a) for the table following sub-paragraph (2) (basic fees for trials), substitute the following—

“Class of Offence
Type of A B C D E F G H I J K
case
Trial
1,32 992. 668. 1,26 318. 323. 323. 323. 323. 1,32 932
6.86 41 67 0.51 90 31 31 44 17 6.86 88",
and

(b) for the table following sub-paragraph (3) (length of trial proxy), substitute the
following—



90%90°9  L1'9TY'S  €6'1TE'S  LL'TIE9'C  8YP60'C  SYP60'C  PS6ELC 98 PSI'S  LYTIVY  I€T8STY  LI'9TPS
0€T19°C  80'900°C  ¥T096'v 6V ¥6E'C  LI968T  LI'968T  vrv6v'c 6L SSLY  TO6E60Y  E€LISTY  80°900°S !
TS8SI'S  66'S8S Y SS86SY  TTLSI'E  S8L69T  S8L69T  098YTE  699SEy  SESLL'E  PI'ITOE  66'SSSY "
ILSOLY  06'S9OL'Y  S89€CYy  S6'616T  LLS6VT  LLS6Y'T  S6V66'T  19°LS6°C  €89SH'€  LS06S'C 067691V i
T6'CSTY  I8SPL'C  IL'898°C  IVLL9T  L8T6TT L8TO6CT 96'0VLT  TS8SSE  L8OLI'E  666SC¢C  I8SPLE “
0v'008°¢c  98CCEE  98°00SC SSYEPT  L6680T  L6680T  YO'L8YT  IL9SI'E  90°S08CT  006T6T  98TTEE B
PELIE'E  €0°€06T  9EOVI‘E  YTS6IT  ILT68'T  ILT6ST  9TYYTT  88LSLT  SSL8Y'T  vP'86ST  €0°€06T "
LTYE6'T  61°€8P T 98°6LLT 681961  €¥'S69°T €' S69°T  1ST100T  v0'6SET  S9OLIT  06L9TT  61°€8YT ’
60°€SY'T  VLLEOT  TLYSETT  6T669°T  9TILY'T  9TILY'T  LLTELT  98°SE6T  61'8IST  $9°006'1  ¥L'LEOT i
06'TL6T  6TT6ST  8S686T  899¢H T  6V'¢STT  6V€STT  vOTOP'T  69TIST  vLSOV'T  SeeeS’ T 6TTO6S'T :
€SLISTT  TTOPI'T  OI'88ST  TOSLI'T  09°0€0°T  09°0€0°T  98°90C°T  TTESO'T  CTESII'T  98I91°T  TTOVI‘L ’
STIE0T L6'S69  9TH6I°] 66'Cl6 8CCI8 8CCI8 120428 LT'T99 LY CoL 0€°S6L L6°S69 .
LO61S ££'8¢C 69°6LL ¢T9e9 60°¢8S 60°¢8S 98'LY9 ¢6'91¢C €0'leg 91°60¥ £€'8¢C ’
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 M
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 I
Y &xoud [ &xoud I &xoad [ &xoud o &xoud g &xoud g Axoud (g &xoad ) Lxoud g &xoud vy Axoud sqoq u1
y13ua) y13uaj y13uaj y13uaj y13ua) y13ua) y13ua) y13uaj y13uaj y13uaj y13ua) y3uay
Ly Uy Uy Uy Ly Ly Ly U U Uy Ly oL,




TO9IT°¢El
T0'9L9°CT
209€TCl
€096L°11
€0'9SET1
S0916°01
SO9LY'01
S0'9¢€0°01
S0'965°6
909S1°6
LO9TL'S
LO9LT'8
LO9E]’L
80°96€°L
609569

019159

SL691°CI
L6 SYLTI
61'8TET1
1¥°L06°01
7998¥°01
$8'590°01
80°S¥9°6
8TYTT'6
16°€08°8
€L'T8E'8
TLYS6°L
79°9TS°L
€5901°L
79899
€€'997°9

9T 918°S

Y18v¢01
¢8'LSO01
CS'L9L'6
STLLY'6
S6'981°6
99°968°8
9€909°8
LO9IE'S
80°TC0°8
8YTLL
6S°LTY'L
8C°0EI°L
89'89L°9
669079
0509

19°€89°C

8EVE6'9
I8°€VL9
9T°€559
1LT9€°9
YITLL'9
8S°186°S
10°16L°S
76°865°C
IL€0Y°S
8%'80C°S
STeI0S
TI8I8Yy
¢8'08S Yy
8 EVEY
1€°901°t

70°698°¢

LOY98°S
9Sv0OL'S
90°StS°S
€9'¥8€°¢C
1€7CTTS
86'650°S
S9°L6SY
vECELY
10°€LSY
89°01t'Y
SE8YTY
01980
8L°L88E
91'689°¢
vI16v'c

18°C6C°¢

LOY98°S
9Sv0L'S
90°StS°S
€9'¥8€°¢C
1€7CTTS
86'650°S
S9°L6SY
vECELY
10°€LSY
8901t
SE8YTY
019807
8L°L88E
9t'689°¢
vI16v'e

18°C6C°¢

98°8¢1°L
€CTY6'9
08'SYL'9
66759
9L°TSE9
€C9S1°9
1L'6S6°S
61°€9L°S
§9'99¢°¢S
YIOLE'S
65°L91°C
¥0°696'Y
Y6'61LY
Y8YLY'Y
YL 6TCY

9¥86°€

9T 19611
TSI9I°T1
8L 19L°01
¥0°T9¢°01
0€296°6
LSTIS°6
18°291°6
80°€9L8
YE€9¢8
65°€96°L
86'95S°L
6C°0SI°L
ITISL9
T1°T8e9
Y0'€S6°S

C6'¢SSS

SE'8Y8'8
€v'76S°8
€6°9€€’8
19°080°8
0LvT8'L
8L89G°L
LSTIEL
1¥°TS0°L
8S°06L°9
¥L°8TS9
¥6°99C°9
61°500°9
79°989°C
01°89¢°S
95°610°S

10'1ELY

8CT'8¢S°6
68°6£C°6
1168
vIEr9'8
SLYYE'S
LEIYO'S
66'LYL'L
19°61¥°L
TTISIL
16°S8°9
8S°0¥S9
TTSET9
€9'706°S
SOYLS'S
8Y'EVT'S

68°TI6Y

SL691°CI
L6SYLTT
61°8TE 11
I¥°L06°01
29°987°01
$8'590°01
80°St9°6
8TYTT'6
16°€08°8
€LT8E'8
TLYS6'L
799TS°L
€5°901°L
79899
$€997°9

9T9t8°S

[43

Ie

0¢

6¢

8¢

LC

9¢

194

14

€C

C

IC

0¢

61

81

Ll

91

10



79TSt 0T
§9°LT0°0T
€8°209°61
€rsLI'61
6S°€SL8T
61°62€81
€6706°L1
18°08%°L1
€8'9S0°L1
86°5€9°91
86°S61°91
86'SSL'ST
86°SIEST
009L8%1
009€r vl
00'966°¢1

00955°€1

cTserel
8L'GTL'SI
LY'9TE 81
€TLTOLL
11°8TS°LI
LO6TI LT
€roeL91
0€1€€91
LSTE6'ST
66'SES ST
0TSIICI
V691
SOELTYI
98°7S8¢Cl
60TV El
1€T10°€1

TS06STI

0T 1981
LI9YI
0L ELE T
SO0EI Yyl
Tr988°¢cl
L8TYICT
9¢€°66¢°¢1
06'SST°El
0S'C16TI
TS0L9TI
TT08¢TI
76'680°CI
€9°66LT1
Y€60S°11
€0'6ICTI
€L'8T6°01

¥r'8€9°01

¥0°60C°6
0S°STI6
86'170°6
678568
00°SL88
vS16L'8
01°80L8
L9YT9'8
LTTYS8
L8'8SH'8
1€°89T°8
SL'LLOS
81°L88°L
79969°L
90905 L
1S°C1E°L

Y6 vTI’L

v€€0T’8
S1°680°8
96°996°L
8L'8V8'L
09°0€L°L
vy T19°L
8TYOY L
€I'9LE"L
86°LST'L
LOOVI'L
950869
LO'1T89
LS 1999
90°C0S°9
LSTYE9
90°€81°9

96°€20°9

v€€0T’8
S1°680°8
96996°L
8L'8V8 L
09°0€L°L
vy CTI9°L
8TYOY L
€I9LE"L
86°LST'L
LOOVI'L
950869
LO'1Z89
LS 1999
90°C0S°9
LSTYE9
90°€81°9

9G°€20°9

88°LEV'6
SL9SE'6
S9'SLT6
8SV61°6
LSEIT'6
YN
79°156'8
1L°0L8°8
€8°68L'8
YO'TIL'S
€SYIS8
00°81¢°8
LY'1CI'8
S6VT6'L
€Y' 8TL'L
06'T€S°L

8ECECL

9689181
0S68L°LI
SIOIY'LI
LSOO LT
0L 15991
T9TLTII
€9°¢68°S1
YLY1S ST
Y6 SEISI
8I'6SLYI
Sr6SEvl
1L°6S6°€C1
96'65S°€1
€C091°¢l
67 09L°CI
YL 09¢°TI

0019611

SI'6I8II
YEIILTI
YSEI9TI
LLOTISTT
T0'80¥ 11
6T SOETT
8S°TOTII
L8660°T1
0T°L66°01
€9°568°01
YL 6€9°01
€8°¢8€°01
16'LT1°01

00CL86

80919°6

81'09¢€°6

9TH01°6

69 107 ¥1
L6'STIYI
Se0s8¢cl
I8YLS €l
Ce66C¢l
86'€70°¢l
89'8¥LCI
61 €LY TI
LES6ITI
€e'STO'll
S6'979°T1
LS8TETT
81°0€0°T1
I8 1€L°01
reerol
Y0 SET°01

99°9¢8°6

Tserel
8L°GTL'81
LY'9TE81
€TLTO6'LT
TT°8TSLI
LO6TI LT
€1'0€L9T
0€1€€91
LSTE6'ST
66'SESST
0TSITSI
V69 Y1
SOELT YL
98°TS8¢El
60CEYEl
IETI0°¢CT

TS06STI

1%

Ly

9

197

144

1914

(44

I

ov

6¢

8¢

LE

9¢

39

v

123

11



0S'TLT'LT
STH89T
v1L1Y'9C
81°066°ST
LE€9S°ST
699€1°6C
Y10IL YT
9L°€8TYT
1S°LS8°€T
6€°1EY°ET
€°'S00°€T
19°6LS°CC
T6'€S1°TC
6€°8TL1T
66T0E°1C

€L°LLYOT

1T°6TS°ST
¥T8TI'ST
SELTLYT
LS9TEYT
LY'ST6ET
6T STSET
6L YTIET
6 VTLTT
01'¥T€TT
06€T6°1C
08°€TS 1T
6L €TIIT
88°€TL0T
90'T¢ 0T
YEYT6'61

eLYTS 61

vv'89L°81
LY €TS 8T
€e'6LTS1
787081
0v'06L°L1
TO9YSLI
69 10€°L1
01" LSO°LI
8I'€I891
6689591
L8YTE9L
6L°080°91
LL9ESST
18°C65°S1
88'8YESI

10°S01°C1

Y1850l
179101
05°08¢°01
6996C°01
16C1T°01
91°6T1°01
17°$¥0°01
691966
00'8L8°6
1€Y6L°6
S9'0IL'6
00°LT9°6
LEEYS'6
9L°65¥°6
LT9LE'6

6ST6C6

Tr'$60°01
01'LL6'6
18'868°6
TSorL6
€096
S6'€0S°6
89°G8¢°6
I¥'L9T°6
Srevle
06'0€0°6
99°C16'8
Trv6L's
0T9L9°8
96°LSS8
SL'6EY'S

vS1TE'S

Tr'$60°01
01'LL6'6
18'868°6
TSorL6
€CTT9°'6
S6'€0S°6
89°G8¢°6
I¥'L9T°6
Srevle
06'0€0°6
99°C16°8
Trv6L's
0T9L9°8
96°LSS8
SL'6EY'S

vS1TE'S

T6'6€L°01
985901
00°LLS 0T
€5°S61°01
LOYIYO1
19°C€€°01
Y1 1ST01
89°691°01
€2°880°01
18°900°01
€'ST6'6
80186
LLTIL'6
61°189°6
¥2°009°6

S0'615°6

9LTSTYT
€8'1L8°ET
86'067°¢C
YTOII°ET
8S°6CLTT
€0'6v€CT
$S'896°1C
81'88S°1C
06'L0T°1C
69°LT8°0C
09'L¥y¥°0C
19°2L90°0C
89°L89°61
98°L0¢61
€1'876'81

0S°81S 81

0899%°¢1
99 €9¢cl
9509T°¢l
8¥'LSTCl
I7'7S0°€1
LETS6TI
vE8Y8°TI
€eSPLTI
SETYITI
LE6ESTI
VoY Tl
05 €€ Tl
65°0£CCI
ILLT1Cl
€80Tl

8612611

SSYT88l
61 LYS 81
TS0LT 81
19°€66°L1
I891LLT
600V LI
Y eI LI
8898891
01991
€0reEE9I
€L LSO9T
1S 18LCI
LESOSST
€€'6CC Sl
9€°€S6' V1

8 LLIVI

1T°6T5°ST
¥T'8T1°ST
SELTLYT
LS 9TEWYT
L8'ST6'ET
6T STSET
6L YT1°ET
6€YTLTT
01¥TETT
06'€T6°1¢C
08'€TSIC
6L€TIIT
88°€TL0T
90'T¢ 0T
YEYT6'61

€ELYTS 61

<9

9

€9

9

19

09

6S

8¢

LS

9¢

99

12

€S

[43

IS

0¢

6V

12



S 98S e
6L9T1°v€
LT L69°EE
68°L9T°€E
$9°8€8°C¢
SS60tCE
09°086°T¢
6L 1SS TE
TreTIie
09'769°0¢
12°997°0¢
96'LE]°6C
98°607°6C
06'186°8¢C
801SS 8T
1¥°921°8¢

68869°LC

8L°09€°TE
SI'8S6'IE
197666 1€
91 €SI IE
€8°0SL°0€
LS 8PE0E
€V'9v6°6C
LEYYS 6T
Tyl
LSOPL'ST
18'8€€°8T
YI'LE6'LT
8G°GESLT
ITYET°LT
YLTELIT
LY 1€€°9C

62°0£6°ST

TEVE6TT
98'889°CC
9" €YY TT
60'861°CC
8LTS6'IT
TSLOLTT
€eTrIT
LT L1T1T
90CL6°0C
10°LTL0T
10°28+°0T
90°LET0T
L1'T66°61
TeLyL'6!l
7sTos6l
6L°LST'61

60°€10°61

SI'9L6'TT
00T68°11
98°L08T1
SLETL T
S96£9°T1
6S°SSSIT
€STILYTT
61 LSETT
LY €0ETT
LY'6ICTTI
0S°SEITI
€SISOTT
8S°L96°01
99°€88°01
SL66L01
98°C1L°01

66 1€9°01

SLLOTTT
T€686°11
06'0L8°T1
8 TSLTI
8091
LYGISTT
8TL6CTT
06'8LT°11
TS09I° 11
SITHo' 11
8L€T601
Tr'S08°01
LOL89°01
TL89S°01
8€°0SY°01
€0TeC01

€LEITOL

SLLOTTT
T€686°11
06'0L8°11
8 TSLTT
80911
LYGISTT
8TL6CTT
06'8LT°11
TS09I° 11
SITHO' 11
8L€T601
Tr'S08°01
LOL89°01
TL89S°01
8€°0SY°01
S0TeC01

€L EITOL

YLYTICL
8T EY0TI
7819611
9¢€°088°11
06'86LT1
Yy LILTT
86°G€9° 11
TSYSSII
90 €LY T
09'T6€°T1
I OIETT
89'8CCI1
TTLYITI
9L°G90°11
0€¥86°01
820601

8¢ 12801

SLTYLOE
¥T09¢°0¢
¥8'LL6'6C
16°665°6T
8TEIT6C
SI'I€8'8T
01°6v¥°8C
91°L90°8C
1€°689°LT
¥SE0E°LT
L81T6'9C
8T 0¥S9C
6L°8S1°9C
IV LLL'ST
11°96€°ST
0610°ST

LL€EYYT

88'TTCSI
SAJINY!
66'S10°ST
8STI6 VI
81'608 71
08°SOL V1
vy 09yl
01°667 11
6L S6E Y1
8V’ T6C Y1
176811
76'$80 V1
0LT86°€C1
61'6L8°CI
8TILLECT
01°€L9El

76'69S°€1

LS LYS €T
LO69T°€T
$9°066'CC
TETILTT
80'vEy T
16°6S1°CT
v LLSIT
78665 1¢C
Y6 1T€°1C
11¥70°1T
9€99L°0C
1L°881°0C
Y1T112°0C
99°€€6°61
€T959°'61
76°8LE 61

0L 101°61

8L°09¢°CE
SI'8S6°1€
19°666° 1€
91 €SI IE
€8°0SL°0€
LS 8YE0E
€V'96°6C
LEYYS 6T
TrTri6c
LS OVL 8T
18'8€€'8C
v1'LE6'LT
8S°CES LT
ITPE1°LT
YLTEL'IT
LY 1€€°9T

6T°0€6°ST

18

08

6L

8L

LL

9L

SL

YL

€L

L

IL

0L

69

89

L9

99

13



€VOSy I
67'810°1Y
89°985°01
Y0 SST°0Y
TSETL 6E
Y1°262°6¢
76'098°8€
¥8°'6Ct'8€
68'866°LE
80'89S°LE
TYLET'LE
16'90L°9¢
€6°9LT°9¢
0€918°S¢E
0T91¥°S¢

ST986't¢€

1T918°8¢
T0TIP 8¢
76°'L00°8¢
16°€09°LE
20°00T°LE
0T96L°9¢
16°26€°9¢
68'886°SE
6£°686°SE
L6 TI81°SE
Y9'8LLYE
T SLEYE
0€TLO EE
LT69S°¢E
rE991°¢e

1$°€9L°TE

TL'898°9C
v¥'TT99C
0T9LE9T
T00€1°9¢C
68°€88°ST
18°L€9°6T
8L16£°ST
08°S¥1°ST
88668 1C
007S9vC
61°80¥+C
172914
89°916°¢T
TO1L9°ET
0’ STY'eT

¥86LIET

00°STE€El
8S°0VTEl
LT'9STCT
SLTLOET
9¢€°L86°CI
66T06CI
¥9°818°CI
0EVELTI
00°0S9°CI
0L°69S°TI
ey ISy Tl
91°L6€TI
T6TIETI
69'8CCCI
0S 1Tl

0€090°CI

85°€0071
¥0°688°C1
0S'99L°¢l
86°LY9°€1
9'6TS€El
Y6 01v €l
€Y TOTEL
€6ELIET
v SS0°€El
96'9¢6°CI
LY'818°C1
00°00LCI
vS 18Tl
60°€97°CI
9YrETI

61°92T°C1

85°€0071
¥0°688°C1
0S'99L°¢l
86°LY9°€1
9'6TS€El
Y6 01v €l
€Y' TOTEL
€6ELIET
v SS0°€El
96'9¢6°CI
LY'818°C1
00°00LCI
vS 18T
60°€97°CI
eI

61°92T°C1

TIsTyel
99'9¥€°¢Cl
0T'S9T¢l
YL ESTET
8TT01°¢Cl
78°020°¢l
9€6£6C1
06'LS8CI
Yy 9LL'TI
86'769°C1
TSE19Tl
90°CESTI
6S°0SYCl
€1'69¢Cl
L9°L8TTI

12°90T°C1

0t'SL]'9¢
r16v9¢
TSLOT 9
TLETL'SE
10°0vE°SE
17956 ¢
88 TLS¥E
vy 6811¢
T1°908°¢¢
LTV CE
TL6E0°EE
99'969°C¢
69°€LTTE
18°068°1¢
¥0'80S°1¢

YeSTIIE

7808891
SO'LLLOT
0€€L9°91
LS 69591
9859191
81°T9€91
1685791
S8 PSI91
TT1S091
19°Ly6°S1
€OPP8SI
9" OrLSI
689¢9°C1
9¢€°€€C Sl
S8'6Cr Sl

9¢€9T¢ S

60°S10°8¢
€TSEL'LT
9" SSYLT
LLSLT'LT
L17968°9C
€9'919°9C
€TLEEIT
88°L50°9C
T9'8LL'ST
SY'661°ST
¢e'0TT'ST
vE Y6 1T
7991
8S°€8EYT
€8'701°vC

91°9T8°¢T

1T918°8¢
T0CIY'8E
76°'L008E
16°€09°LE
20'00C°LE
0T'96L°9¢
1S776£°9¢
68'886°S€
6€°685°C¢
L6 T181°SE
Y9'8LLYE
Y SLEYE
0€TL6'EE
LT 69S°€E
rE991°€e

1S°€9L°TE

86

L6

96

S6

¥6

€6

6

16

06

68

88

L8

98

e8

78

€8

[4

14



91°608°8Y
Y0'9LE'SY
T6'TY6 LY
6L°60S LY
89°9L0°LY
SSEY9 9
vy 01T'9Y
TE€LLLSY
61 vre' Sy
LOTI6 Y
66'LLY VY
90°SY0 v
9TTI9EY
19°6L1°EY
60°LYLTY
YLYIETY

16778811

17 COL Sy
9$96T°SY
18°068 1
91°S8Y v
6S°6L0 VY
YIvLEY
8L'89T°¢Y
16°€98°Ch
YE8SY Ty
LTESOTY
6T 8791
eVl
79°8€8°0F
96°€EY 0
LE'620°0F
68'179°6€

0$°0TT°6¢

€' e90°TE
LTII8°0E
S1'695°0€
01°2TE0¢
60°SLO°0E
S1'8T8°6C
vT185°6C
6£EE6C
65°L80°6C
¢8'0¥8°8C
SI'¥6S°8T
0S°LYE'8T
16°001°8C
8EVS8LT
LY LO9LT
SY19€°LT

SO'SIT'LT

80°09L V1
LYSLIYI
9T 1651
€8°90S 71
Tyl
10°8€€ vl
8 €STYI
LT691 71
SLY80 Y1
€€°000 71
65161
0S°1€8°€l
80°LYL €1
L9T99°¢1
CT8LSCT
€8 cov el

re0r el

1661091
YT 106°ST
8ST8LST
¥6'€99°C1
6T SYSSI
99'9Ct'C1
20'80€°ST
I7'681°61
6L°0L0°ST
81'TS611
8S€E] Y1
66VILYI
0v'965 11
€8 LLY' V1
9T 6SEY1
0L 0vTy1

v1ITTIYI

1661091
YT 106°ST
8ST8LST
¥6'€99°C1
6T SYSSI
99'9Ct'C1
T0'80€°ST
I7°681°61
6L°0L0°ST
81'TS611
8S€E] Y1
66VILYI
0v'965 11
€S’ LLY' V1
9T 6SE Y1
0L 0vTy1

v1ITTIYI

96CI8 V1
0S'TELYI
Y0'0S9v1
8S°89S 1
ULyl
99°S0t v1
61vTEYI
ELTYT YL
LTI91Y1
08'6L071
7€'866°C1
88°916°¢CI
T sesel
96°€SLEl
0STLYCl
YO 16S°€1

85°60S°€C1

6T LIV'EY
vLIE0EY
LTY9CY
16'09T°Ch
19°6L8 1Y
er'o6v 1y
rESOI Ty
€e0CL' 0y
Ty secoy
09°0S6°6¢
68595 6€
STI8I'6E
1L'96L°8€
9T TI¥ 8¢
06°LT0°8¢
Y9 EV9°LE

8Y'6ST°LE

L99¥9°81
LLTYS'ST
LY'8EY8I
86'V¢E 81
60 1€C81
0T’ LTI8I
0€°€20°81
0v'616°LI
1SCI8°LI
TYTILLI
€L LO9LT
¥8°€0S LI
76'66¢ L1
8096C°LI
€TTOILI
17°880°L1

1978691

T6'T8LTE
¥TT0STE
8S°1CTCE
16°0v6°1¢
vT099°1¢
8C6LETE
06'860°1¢
¥T'818°0¢
9¢°LES 0E
96'9ST°0¢
Tr9L6°6C
L6'S69°6C
19°61+°6T
SESEI'6T
C1'SS8°'8T
S0'SLS'ST

€0°S6C°'8T

I¥°20L Sy
9596C°SY
18°068 1
91°S8Y v¥
6S6L0'VY
YIvL9'EY
8L'89T°¢Y
16°€98°Ct
vE8SY Ty
LTESOTY
6T8Y9°' 1Y
rEYT1Y
¥9°8¢8°0F
96°€Cy 0
LE6TO0Y
68779°6€

0S°0TT°6¢

141!

el

[41!

IT1

o1t

601

801

LOT

901

SOl

YOI

€0l

01

101

00T

66

15



6T°669°SS
L9TLT'SS
€0'918°tS
reIr'vs
6LT66°ES
91°995°¢S
rS6E1°€S
STLOLTS
YIvLTTS
10 1¥8°1S
06'LOY'TS
LLYL60S
S9' 11508
€5°801°0S
0v'SLY"6Y

6T YT 6

YL 0S1TS
TTOSL'IS
IL6VE 1S
0T'616°0S
L9"8¥S°0S
SI'8Y1°0S
Y9 LYL 6y
[AWA 2N %
19°96°81
60°97S'8Y
9S°6€1°8Y
TIEEL’LY
6L9TE LY
¢S°0T6'9%
I v1S91

9¢€°801°9¥

81166 7€
W LYLYE
LEE0SPE
1€6STYE
STSIOPE
0T ILL'EE
v1°LTS €
80°€8T €
€0°6£0°¢E
L6'V6LTE
SY'LYSTE
66'66CTE
LSTSOTE
1T°608°1¢
68°LSSTE

€9°0I€TE

79°S01°91
6¥'T2091
CE6L6°ST
61°958°C1
€OELLGT
L9°889°C1
9T ¥09°C1
€8°61S°CI
Ty SeErSI
10°1S€°C1
85°99T°C1
ANAINY!
9L°L60°ST
€eer0sI
7687611

1SYP8yI

SSYI6'LI
9€96L"L1
91°'8L9"LT
S6'6SS°L1
SLIVY' LT
98" €TE LI
SESOT’LT
SI'L8O°LT
$6'896°91
SL'0S891
Y0'TELOT
€C€19°91
€961 91
Y6'SLEIT
STLSTI1

8S°8€1°91

SSYI6'LI
9€96L"L1
91°8L9"LT
S6'6SS°L1
SLIVY' LT
98" €TE LI
SESOT’LT
SI'L8O°LT
$6'896°91
SL'0S891
Y0TELOT
€C€19°91
€961 91
Y6'SLEIT
STLSTI1

8S°8€1°91

€C911°91
L8YE091
0Or'€S6°ST
Y6 1L8ST
8¥°06L°S1
T0'60L°SI
9¢°LT9°CT
01'9%S°SI
Ay
81°¢8€°SI
TLTOEST
9T°0TT'S1
08'8E1°SI
Y€ LSOST
88°SL6I

[AAL 37!

1Tevsor
TLT9T6Y
€TT8L'SY
YL 10V 8
ST1T0'8Yy
SLOVO'LY
9T 09T'LY
8L°6L8°9Y
8T 6679
6L 811°9%
8CTEL'SY
9" 9re Sy
S¥'096 v
SYLS v
89'881 7Y

7608 ¢y

60'86C°0C
9L°S61°0C
€¥'€60°0C
6016661
SL'888°61
Tr98L°61
60'89°61
1L185°61
I8'LLY'61
T6°€LE6]
€0'0LT'61
v1°991°61
¥TT90°61
7€'856°81
SYvS88l

95" 0SL 81

SOSYTLE
09896°9¢
¥1°269°9¢
89°CI¥'9¢
TT6E1'9¢E
LL'T98°SE
1€°98G°C¢
76°80¢°S¢E
9T'8T0°S¢
09 LYL'YE
T6'99¥' ¢
9T 981v¢
65°S06°¢E
T6'7T9°€e
9T rreee

85°€90°¢E

YL 0S1°TS
TTOSLTS
IL6VETS
0T'6¥6°0S
L9'8¥S°0S
SI'8¥1°0S
Yo' LYL 6
TILYE6v
19°9%6°8%
60975 8%
95°6€1°8Y
TreeL'Ly
6L9TE LY
SS0C6'9Y
7 v1S9%

9€'801°9%

Iel

0¢l

6¢Cl

8¢C1

LTI

9Cl

4!

14!

el

[44!

IC1

0cI

611

811

LTT

911

CIl

16



1615679
8T°STSTY
998609
€0TL9'19
7' SYT19
6L°818°09
S1°T6£09
¥$696°6S
16'8£5°6S
8TTIT'6S
L9°689°8¢
€0°65C'8S
I7°CE8°LS
6L°S0V" LS
91°6L6'9S
¥$TSS9¢

16°ST1°9S

756568
10°655°8S
61'8S1°8S
86°LSL'LS
LY LSE'LS
7695695
Tr'985°9¢
16°6S1°9S
6€°SSL'SS
88'SECS
9€'¥S6' VS
78 €SS YS
TEESIYS
18°CSLES
0€°TSEES
8L 1S6TS

STISSTS

9" 0r1°6E
17°968°8¢
CETSI'8E
62 807'8€
YTY91°8¢
81'0T6°LE
TI'9LY°LE
LOTEY'LE
10°881°LE
C6'€P6'9€
68'669°9¢
€8'6SY'9¢
LLT1T9E
1L°L96°SE
99°€TL'SE
09°6L¥'S¢E

¥SGETSE

1T61S°LI
SO9EY LI
06CSELI
SL69T'L1
19°981°LI
S0l LT
62 0C0°L1
SI'LE69T
007S8°91
S8'0LL9T
0L°L89°91
¥S 10991
6€° 12591
STREYII
01°66€°91
S6'1LTI1

6L°881°91

96'€76'61
LLS08°61
95°L89°61
9€°695°61
LT 1SV 61
L6TEC61
9L YIT61
95960°61
LE8L6T
91°098°81
S6 1YL 81
9L°€T9°81
96°60S 81
CCTL8E8T
S1'69C°81
96'0S1°81

9L°TE08I

96'€76'61
LLS08°61
95°L89°61
9€°695°61
LT 1SV 61
L6TEC61
9L YIT61
95960°61
LE8L68T
91°098°81
S6 1YL 81
9L°€T9°81
9¢°60S 81
CCL8E8T
S1'69C°81
96'0S1°81

9L°TE08I

91 T0S LT
OL'61Y LI
YT 8EC LI
8L9ST°L1
TESLILY
98°€60°L1
Ov'CIOLI
¥6'0€6°91
8¥'678°91
T0'89L91
9698991
01°609°91
Y9 €TS91
81'THY 91
TL09€91
ST6LTI1

6LL61°91

SS'I10°9¢
90°1€9°CS
96°0ST°SS
80°0L8 VS
65 687 1S
60601 vS
09°8TLES
11°81€°€S
79°L96°TS
€I'L8STS
¥9°90C°TS
SI'9T8°1S
99 SHY IS
LT°S90°TS
89'%89°0S
6110€°0S

0L €T6°6Y

08°LE0TT
9'SE6 1T
ereesIe
08°0€L°1C
9"8T9°1¢C
T19zsIe
6L ETVIT
9" 1TE 1T
TrelTIc
8L9ITIC
SY¥10°1C
T1'CI6°0¢
8L°608°0C
€¥'LOLOT
01°609°0C
LL'TOS 0T

¥1"00%°0C

986 1
6£899° 1Y
€6’ 16€ Y
8V SITIY
20°6€8°0Y
957950
60'98C°0F
$9'600°0%
8I'€CL'6E
TL9SY 6¢
9T°081°6¢
18°€06°8¢
CELT9'8E
88'0S€ '8¢
€V rLO'SE
86'LO6L'LE

161TS°LE

75°656°8S
10°65S°8S
61°8S1°8S
86'LSL°LS
LY LSE'LS
¥6'956°9S
95598
16°SS1°96
6€°GSL'SS
88SE S
9EYS6'vS
¥ €CSYS
TEESIYS
18°CSLES
0€TSE€eS
8L 1S6°CS

STISSTS

Lyl

4!

94!

144!

vl

i

4!

ovl

6¢l

8¢l

LET

9¢l

Gel

vel

eel

(43!

17



16'LLL69
LT1SE°69
S9tT6°89
€0'861°89
0 1L0°89
8LYY9°L9
SI'81T°LY
€S 16L99
16'79€°99
LT8E6'S9
99'115°¢9
€0°680°69
0v'859'%9
6L 1€CY9
S1'S08°¢€9

€6°8LEE9

6L°L9E°S9
8T L9619
LL99S Y9
ST991°v9
YL SIL €9
17°69¢€°€9
6919679
8149579
L9€91°C9
SI'€9L19
€9'79¢°19
11729609
6519509
80°191°09
LS 09L°6S

S0°09¢°6S

LESYO'EY
1€108°Ch
9T’ LSS TY
0TEIETY
¥1°690°TY
60°ST8' 1Y
€O I8S Iy
L69EE Y
T6'T60° 1Y
98'818°0F
08'709°0F
SL'09€E 0
69°911°0¥
€9°TL8'6E
8S°879°6€

TSP8e6E

7961881
9'99L°81
0€€89°81
91°009°81
10°L1S°81
98°€EP 8l
1L°0S€°81
CSL9T'81
0v'¥81°81
9T’ 101°81
11°810°81
96'7€6°L1
08 1S8°LI
C9'89L°L1
0S°S89°LI

9€TO9°LI

8I'CI8'IC
L6'969°1C
LL8LS 1T
8S°09%°1C
LETYETT
LTYCTIT
86°S01°1T
LL'L86°0T
LS'698°0C
LETSLOT
81°€€9°0C
L6Y1S°0T
9L96€°0C
LS'8LT 0T
LE091°0C

91°T¥0°0C

8I'SI8'IC
L6'969°1C
LL8LS 1T
8S°09%°1C
LETYETT
LTYCTIT
86°S01°1T
LL'L86°0T
LS'698°0C
LETSLOT
81°€€9°0C
L6Y1S°0T
9L96€°0C
LS'8LT 0T
LE091°0C

91°C¥0°0C

vS Y0881
80°€TL'81
9 1¥9°81
91°095°81
0L'SLY'SI
YT L6E 8]
8L GIE 8T
TEYET8I
S8TSI'81
6€1L0°81
€6'686°L1
9t'806°L1
00°LT8'LI
vSSYLLL
80'799°L1

T9T8S°LI

66079
T6'8IL19
€Y'8€€ 19
¥6°'LS6°09
SY'LLS 09
96'961°09
91'918°6S
86'SEY 6S
81°SS0°6S
66'L9°8S
0S'¥67°8S
10716°LS
TSEESLS
TOESILS
€STLLYS

S0'T6£9S

L1°SL9*€T
€8'TLS €T
0S°0LY'€T
L1'89€°€T
€8'69T°¢T
81 €91°¢T
SI'190°cc
78'856°TC
81'968°CC
Y1I¥SLTT
18169
81'6¥STC
v1'LyYTT
08¢ TC
LY TYTTT

Y1°0v1°TC

81°89€°9¥
€L’ 160°9Y
LTSIS'SY
18'8€S°SH
SeT9T'SY
06'$86' 1Y
€' 60L vy
L6TEY Y
S9ST v
90°088°¢Y
09°€09°cY
vILTE €Y
69°050°cY
ETYLLTY
9L L6v Ty

1€1TTTY

6L°L9€°S9
8T LI6H9
LL99S V9
ST V9
vL'S9L°€9
1T°69€°€9
6979679
8149579
L9°€91°C9
SI'€9L'19
€9°79¢°19
11°296°09
6519509
80°191°09
LS 09L°6S

S009¢°6S

91

€91

1

191

091

651

8C1

LS

9¢1

39!

12!

€Sl

(49!

IS1

0SI

6vI

871

18



1S°0€0°LL
06'€09°9L
LTLLI9L
¥9°0SL°SL
€0YTESL
6€L68 VL
LLOLY' YL
SIYPOvL
TSLI9'EL
06°061°€L
LTYILTL
S9°LECTL
€OTI6'TL
6E V8T IL
8L°LSOIL
ST 1€9°0L

TSY0T0L

6S9LITL
909LL IL
CCCLETL
Y0'SL6°0L
TSYLSOL
107L1°0L
81 €LL69
96TLE69
SY'TL6'89
¥6° 1,589
TV ILI'89
06'0LL'L9
8€°0LEL9
9869699
$€'695°99
7889199

TE8ILS9

SEVOLLY
0€°0S6°9Y
YT90L 9
81°T97°9%
cr'8Icoy
LOYL6'SY
10°0€L°SY
S6'S8Y'SY
68 17T Sy
€8'L66' VY
8L ESLYY
TL60S Y
99°69T v
09120t
YSLLLEY
8pees ey

€Y'68T°cYy

L1°€9T°0C
20081°0C
L8960°0¢C
TLE10°0C
95°0€6°61
17 Ly8°61
LTYIL'61
T1189°61
L6°L6S°61
1871561
99 1¢v°61
s8re6l
LESIT61
Teslel
90'660°61
16°S10°61

9L°T€6°81

6ST8°€T
8€90L €T
61°885°€T
66'697°€C
8L ISE €T
8STEETET
6€SI1°€C
81°L66°CC
86'8L8°CC
8L 09LTT
8STH9TT
8€YCS T
81'90%°CC
86'L8C'CC
8L691°CT
LS 180°TT

8E7€E6'IT

65 7T8°€T
8€90L°€T
61°885°€T
66'697°€C
8L ISE €T
8ST€ETET
6€SI1°€C
81°L66°CC
86'8L8°CC
8L09LTT
8STH9TT
8E€YCS T
81'90%°CC
86'L8CCC
8L691°CT
LS 180°CT

8E7€E6'IT

8¢€°681°0C
16'L01°0C
$¥'920°0¢
6677661
€5°€98°61
90°C8L61
09°00L°61
r1°619°61
89°LES61
TT9st61
9LYLE 6T
0€€6T°61
Y8 1161
8¢0€1°61
7687061
9t°'L96°81

00'988°81

GL'L9S'89
9T'L81°89
LL908°L9
8T9TY'LY
6L S¥0°L9
0€°699°99
18%87°99
TE06°S9
€8°¢TS°S9
YEErIS9
C8'T9L'Y9
9€°T8EY9
L8 T00Y9
8¢°179°¢€9
68°0YC°¢€9
6£°098°79

16'6L1°C9

L8VIY'ST
€STIEST
61°01C°ST
98°L01°ST
€5°500°ST
61°€061C
$8°008vC
7$°8691C
61°9651C
S8'e6v v
1S 16€4T
81°68C1C
$8'981°%C
1$780+C
L1'T86°CT
¥8°6L8°€T

ISLLL'ET

86°'L90°1S
TS16L°0S
90°S15°0S
19°8€T°0S
S1'296'6Y
89'G89°6Y
€T 60v 6
8LTEI'6Y
1€968°81
C8'6LS S
0" €0¢ 8P
¥6'920°8¥
8°0SLLY
10'VLY LY
LS'L6T'LY
1112691

Y979 9y

6S9L1CL
90'9LL'TL
CCCLE L
¥0°SL6°0L
TSYLSOL
10'VLT°0L
8 €LL69
96TLE 69
SY'TL6'89
¥6'1LS°89
TYIL1°89
06'0LL LY
8€°0LELY
9869699
$€69599
¥8°891°99

TE8ILS9

081

6L1

8LI

LLT

9LI1

GLI

VLI

€Ll

CLT

ILT

0LT

691

891

L91

991

¢o1

19



16°968°¢8
68°6Ct'€8
LT€00°€8
€99L5°C8
200S1°C8
6€°€TLIS
9L96T°18
S1°0L8°08
1S°€v08
68910°08
LT06S°6L
¥9°€91°6L
TOLEL'SL
6€01€8L
LLESSLL

SULSY'LL

98'¥8S°8L
€EP8I'8L
TS ESLLL
1€°€8¢°LL
6L786°9L
8TTYSIL
SLISI9L
€TI8L'SL
TL08ESL
17086 tL
69°6LS VL
LU6LTYL
SOSLL'EL
YI'SLEEL
T9LL6TL

IT°LLSTL

9T'660°1S
0T'SS8°0S
SI'T19°0S
60°L9€°0S
€0°€TI0S
86'8L8'6Y
6'7€9°6Y
98°06¢ 61
18°9%1°61
SLT06'8Y
69'859°8Y
Y9 v1v 8y
8S°OLI'SY
TS9T6°LY
LY'T89'LY

17'8EV'LY

LS€6STT
€r'0IS 1T
8TLTV'IT
erppele
8609C°1¢C
T8LLI'TC
L9Y60°1C
€ST10°IT
8€'876°0C
€TSY8°0T
LOTIL0T
76'8L9°0C
LLS65°0C
€9°CIS0C
81'6CY°0C

TE9rE0T

6L SIL'ST
09°L6S°ST
Ov'6LY'ST
61°19€°SC
00°€¥T°ST
08+TI°ST
65°900°ST
6€888YC
0CTOLLYT
66 1S91C
6L €ES YT
65 SIY'vC
6€°L6T YT
61°6LIVC
86'090'%°C

6L TY6'€T

6L SIL'ST
09°L6S°ST
Ov'6LY'ST
61°19€°6C
00°€¥T°ST
08+TI°ST
659006
6€8887C
0CTOLLYT
66 1S91C
6L €ES YT
65 SIY'vC
6€°L6TYC
61°6LIVC
86'090'7°C

6L TY6'ET

OL'SLY'IC
9" S6€° 1T
TTSIE T
86T 1T
YLYSIIC
0SLO°1C
9T'¥66°0C
0v16°0C
8L7€€8°0C
¥SESL0T
0€°€L9°0C
90°€65°0C
T8'C1S0C
65°TEY0T
0€TSE0T

¥8°0LT0C

T9°SS9YL
TISLTYL
€9v68°CL
PIvISEL
SOEEIEL
91°€SLTL
99°TLETL
LI'T66'TL
69 119°1L
61 1€C 1L
0L0S8°0L
0TOLYOL
TL680°0L
€C°60L°69
€L'8TE°69

¥T'816°89

YT TSO'LT
06'616°9C
9¢°L¥8°9C
€TSPL9T
06T¥9°9C
95°0¥S°9C
TT8EY9T
68'S£€°9C
9$°€€T9C
TTIEN9C
88'870°9¢
$$'976°'ST
TTYT8'ST
L1TLST
¥$619°SC

1TLISST

TE16¥°SS
98'v1T°SS
086 VS
€6'199'%S
61 S8EYS
€0'601°7S
9¢°TE8ES
01°965°¢S
S96LTES
61°€00°¢S
€L'9TLTS
LTOSYTS
T8ELITS
9¢€°L6STS
68°079°1S

Yrvrels

98'18S°8L
€CY8I'8L
T8E8LLL
1€€8E°LL
6L°786°9L
8TT8SIL
SLI8I9L
€TI8LSL
TL08ESL
1T086vL
69°6LS VL
JANTYAR 72
SO8LLEL
v1'8LEEL
T9LL6TL

TT'LLSTL

L6l

961

g6l

v61

€6l

[49!

Iel

06l

681

881

L8I

981

e8I

¥81

€81

(43!

181

20



113

10°€95°68
6€9€1°68
9L°60LY8

Y1 €8CTH8

76'981°08
17°98L°6L
68'S8E°6L

8¢°G86'8L

61'SLOTS
€Y IE8IS
LELSSTS

TEEVEIS

81°9T6°1¢C
€0'er8°IT
68°6SL°1C

€L°9L9°1T

65°881°9¢C
0¥'0L0°9¢
0T'TS6'ST

66°€€8°ST

65°881°9¢C
0¥'0L0°9¢
0T'TS6'ST

66°€€8°ST

9996L°1¢C
TY9IL1T
81°9€9°1T

¥6'SSS 1T

8C°LLIOL
60°L6L'SL
09°91¥°SL

01°9€0°SL

8S19¥°LT
YT 6SE°LT
06'9ST°LT

LS¥ST°LT

SI'L6S9S
0L°0TE9S
€TYP0°9S

LLLYL'SS

T6981°08
I7°98L°6L
68°S8E°6L

8¢'C86'8L

00¢

661

861

21



3. In paragraph 8 (cracked trials and guilty pleas where the number of pages of prosecution
evidence exceeds the PPE Cut-off), for the tables following sub-paragraph (2) (table of final fees
in cracked trials and table of final fees in guilty pleas), including the headings to the tables,
substitute the following—

“Table of final fees in cracked trials

Class of Offence PPE Range Initial Fee (£) Incremental fee per
page of prosecution
evidence (£)

A 0-79 817.84 0

A 80-249 817.84 9.67

A 250-999 2,461.79 6.07

A 1000-2799 7,013.99 3.55

A 2800-4599 13,399.58 3.55

A 4600-6399 19,785.18 2.82

A 6400-8199 24,854.29 2.82

A 8200-9999 29,923.39 2.82

A 10,000 34,989.69 0

B 0-69 641.15 0

B 70-249 641.15 7.07

B 250-999 1,914.60 3.31

B 1000-2799 4,398.09 2.21

B 2800-4599 8,367.99 2.21

B 4600-6399 12,337.89 1.85

B 6400-8199 15,675.89 1.85

B 8200-9999 19,013.87 1.85

B 10,000 22,350.01 0

C 0-39 474.52 0

C 40-249 474.52 3.55

C 250-999 1,219.43 2.03

C 1000-2799 2,742.22 1.29

C 2800-4599 5,069.77 1.29

C 4600-6399 7,397.33 1.29

C 6400-8199 9,724.89 1.29

C 8200-9999 12,052.45 1.29

C 10,000 14,378.71 0

D 0-79 776.94 0

D 80-249 776.94 9.16

D 250-999 2,334.87 5.52

D 1000-2799 6,476.83 3.26

D 2800-4599 12,346.28 3.26

D 4600-6399 18,215.74 2.68

D 6400-8199 23,032.00 2.68

D 8200-9999 27,848.26 2.68

D 10,000 32,661.85 0

E 0-39 210.69 0

E 40-249 210.69 4.16

E 250-999 1,084.41 1.32

E 1000-2799 2,071.81 0.55

E 2800-4599 3,065.16 0.55

E 4600-6399 4,058.52 0.55

E 6400-8199 5,051.89 0.55



ARARAARS S S S SSsssm s s s FODDIDIT I TR IQQQQQmTH ™™™ ™™ ™o

8200-9999
10,000
0-49
50-249
250-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-49
50-249
250-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-39
40-249
250-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-39
40-249
250-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-79
80-249
250-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-119
120-249
250-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399

23

6,045.25
7,038.05
202.72
202.72
1,001.33
2,215.42
3,349.43
4,483.43
5,617.43
6,751.43
7,884.80
202.72
202.72
1,001.33
2,215.42
3,349.43
4,483.43
5,617.43
6,751.43
7,884.80
214.28
214.28
1,023.10
2,077.83
3,210.31
4,342.78
5,475.25
6,607.73
7,739.57
229.35
229.35
1,353.27
2,922.00
4,382.54
5,843.07
7,303.60
8,764.14
10,223.85
817.84
817.84
2,461.79
7,013.99
13,399.58
19,785.18
24,854.29
29,923.39
34,989.69
699.66
699.66
1,469.04
4,872.23
12,023.79
19,175.37

0.55

3.99
1.62
0.63
0.63
0.63
0.63
0.63

3.99
1.62
0.63
0.63
0.63
0.63
0.63

3.85
1.41
0.63
0.63
0.63
0.63
0.63

5.35
2.09
0.81
0.81
0.81
0.81
0.81

9.67
6.07
3.55
3.55
2.82
2.82
2.82

5.92
4.54
3.97
3.97
3.39



K 6400-8199 25,273.74 3.39
K 8200-9999 31,372.12 3.39
K 10,000 37,467.10 0
Table of final fees in guilty pleas
Class of Offence PPE Range Initial Fee (£) Incremental fee per
page of prosecution
evidence (£)
A 0-79 615.14 0
A 80-399 615.14 5.08
A 400-999 2,240.64 2.68
A 1000-2799 3,847.97 1.71
A 2800-4599 6,931.71 1.71
A 4600-6399 10,015.43 1.01
A 6400-8199 11,835.33 1.01
A 8200-9999 13,655.24 1.01
A 10,000 15,474.14 0
B 0-69 502.79 0
B 70-399 502.79 4.08
B 400-999 1,850.34 2.06
B 1000-2799 3,084.59 1.31
B 2800-4599 5,448.09 1.31
B 4600-6399 7,811.60 0.96
B 6400-8199 9,543.20 0.96
B 8200-9999 11,274.79 0.96
B 10,000 13,005.42 0
C 0-39 400.44 0
C 40-399 400.44 2.41
C 400-999 1,267.46 1.32
C 1000-2799 2,058.00 0.72
C 2800-4599 3,345.14 0.72
C 4600-6399 4,632.30 0.72
C 6400-8199 5,919.46 0.72
C 8200-9999 7,206.61 0.72
C 10,000 8,493.05 0
D 0-79 584.38 0
D 80-399 584.38 4.73
D 400-999 2,098.13 2.48
D 1000-2799 3,587.84 1.55
D 2800-4599 6,370.53 1.55
D 4600-6399 9,153.23 0.96
D 6400-8199 10,882.75 0.96
D 8200-9999 12,612.25 0.96
D 10,000 14,340.79 0
E 0-39 166.99 0
E 40-399 166.99 2.64
E 400-999 1,118.60 1.13
E 1000-2799 1,798.34 0.42
E 2800-4599 2,549.32 0.42
E 4600-6399 3,300.30 0.42
E 6400-8199 4,051.28 0.42
E 8200-9999 4,802.26 0.42
E 10,000 5,552.82 0

24



ARARARARAARTS S S S sfrA s ST "IN DIITTIIT QWM omT ™™o

0-49
50-399
400-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-49
50-399
400-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-39
40-399
400-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-39
40-399
400-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-79
80-399
400-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-119
120-399
400-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999

25

177.04
177.04
1,073.84
1,610.41
2,128.34
2,646.26
3,164.19
3,682.12
4,199.75
177.04
177.04
1,073.84
1,610.41
2,128.34
2,646.26
3,164.19
3,682.12
4,199.75
172.66
172.66
1,081.85
1,619.03
2,133.57
2,648.12
3,162.66
3,677.21
4,191.45
157.86
157.86
1,174.01
1,913.36
2,742.18
3,571.00
4,399.83
5,228.67
6,057.03
615.14
615.14
2,240.64
3,847.97
6,931.71
10,015.43
11,835.33
13,655.24
15,474.14
579.39
579.39
1,910.50
3,498.21
7,934.06
12,369.90
15,752.56
19,135.22

2.56
0.89
0.29
0.29
0.29
0.29
0.29

2.56
0.89
0.29
0.29
0.29
0.29
0.29

2.53
0.90
0.29
0.29
0.29
0.29
0.29

2.82
1.23
0.46
0.46
0.46
0.46
0.46

5.08
2.68
1.71
1.71
1.01
1.01
1.01

4.75
2.65
2.46
2.46
1.88
1.88
1.88



K 10,000 22,515.98 0.

4. In paragraph 9 (trials where the number of pages of prosecution evidence exceeds the PPE
Cut-off), for the table following sub-paragraph (2) (table of final fees in trials), substitute the
following—

“Class of Offence PPE Range Initial Fee (£) Incremental fee per
page (£)
A 0-79 1,326.86 0
A 80-209 1,326.86 14.99
A 210-699 3,275.18 11.44
A 700-1049 8,882.80 9.61
A 1050-1999 12,244.73 8.33
A 2000-3599 20,157.51 7.61
A 3600-5199 32,337.32 7.61
A 5200-6799 44,517.12 7.61
A 6800-8399 56,696.95 7.61
A 8400-9999 68,876.76 7.61
A 10,000 81,048.96 0
B 0-69 992.41 0
B 70-199 992.41 11.58
B 200-499 2,497.70 10.35
B 500-899 5,601.30 8.71
B 900-1299 9,084.69 7.32
B 1300-1999 12,011.13 6.41
B 2000-3299 16,499.55 6.41
B 3300-4999 24.,835.21 6.41
B 5000-5999 35,735.68 6.41
B 6000-7999 42,147.72 6.41
B 8000-8999 54,971.80 6.41
B 9000-9999 61,383.84 6.41
B 10,000 67,789.47 0
C 0-39 668.67 0
C 40-299 668.67 9.55
C 300-799 3,152.22 8.35
C 800-1249 7,324.86 6.98
C 1250-1999 10,467.86 6.18
C 2000-3199 15,099.47 4.27
C 3200-4559 20,223.84 4.27
C 4560-5919 26,031.46 4.27
C 5920-7279 31,839.08 4.27
C 7280-8639 37,646.71 4.27
C 8640-9999 43,454.33 4.27
C 10,000 49,257.70 0
D 0-79 1,260.51 0
D 80-209 1,260.51 14.24
D 210-699 3,111.41 10.87
D 700-1049 8,438.66 9.13
D 1050-1999 11,632.50 7.91
D 2000-3599 19,149.63 7.23
D 3600-5199 30,720.44 7.23
D 5200-6799 42,291.27 7.23
D 6800-8399 53,862.10 7.23
D 8400-9999 65,432.92 7.23

26



el el sl co e sliasliaslic siias iz siics i sl sl a NoONa No No No No Na No Neo WMo Nes e Mes Mo slle s Mes Beslles MesliesMes MesllcsMesMeslcs MesllicsMes Mesles Nesllw)

10,000
0-39

40-69
70-129
130-599
600-1349
1350-2999
3000-4749
4750-6499
6500-8249
8250-9999
10,000
0-49
50-229
230-699
700-1399
1400-1949
1950-3549
3550-5149
5150-6749
6750-8349
8350-9999
10,000
0-49
50-229
230-699
700-1399
1400-1949
1950-3549
3550-5149
5150-6749
6750-8349
8350-9999
10,000
0-39
40-249
250-619
620-1299
1300-2999
3000-4999
5000-5999
6000-6999
7000-7999
8000-8999
9000-9999
10,000
0-39
40-369
370-799
800-1299
1300-2699
2700-4199
4200-5359

27

76,996.51
318.90
318.90
577.01
1,042.06
4,565.52
8,256.29
11,819.21
15,598.07
19,376.92
23,155.77
26,932.46
323.31
323.31
1,512.77
4,472.31
8,015.66
10,164.34
13,282.65
16,400.96
19,519.27
22,637.58
25,851.39
323.31
323.31
1,512.77
4,472.31
8,015.66
10,164.34
13,282.65
16,400.96
19,519.27
22,637.58
25,851.39
323.44
323.44
1,955.51
4,346.77
7,611.47
14,089.28
18,199.58
20,254.67
22,309.83
24,364.99
26,420.15
28,473.24
323.17
323.17
3,050.16
6,584.12
10,649.53
19,617.04
23,746.01

8.60
7.75
7.50
4.92
2.16
2.16
2.16
2.16
2.16

6.61
6.30
5.06
391
1.95
1.95
1.95
1.95
1.95

6.61
6.30
5.06
391
1.95
1.95
1.95
1.95
1.95

7.77
6.46
4.80
3.81
2.06
2.06
2.06
2.06
2.06
2.06

8.26
8.22
8.13
6.41
2.75
2.75



I 5360-6519 26,939.07 2.75
I 6520-7679 30,132.14 2.75
I 7680-8839 33,325.22 2.75
I 8840-9999 36,518.28 2.75
I 10,000 39,708.59 0

J 0-79 1,326.86 0

J 80-209 1,326.86 14.99
J 210-699 3,275.18 11.44
J 700-1049 8,882.80 9.61
J 1050-1999 12,244.73 8.33
J 2000-3599 20,157.51 7.61
J 3600-5199 32,337.32 7.61
J 5200-6799 44,517.12 7.61
J 6800-8399 56,696.95 7.61
J 8400-9999 68,876.76 7.61
J 10,000 81,048.96 0

K 0-119 932.88 0

K 120-734 932.88 7.83
K 735-1289 5,746.58 7.88
K 1290-2399 10,120.31 8.02
K 2400-4499 19,024.76 7.99
K 4500-7999 35,807.93 7.99
K 8000-8399 63,779.87 7.99
K 8400-8799 66,976.65 7.99
K 8800-9199 70,173.44 7.99
K 9200-9599 73,370.24 7.99
K 9600-9999 76,567.04 7.99
K 10,000 79,755.84 0.

5.In paragraph 11(a) (fixed fee for guilty pleas or cracked trials), for “£330.33” substitute
“£298.65”.

6. For the table following paragraph 19(b) (fixed fees), substitute the following—

“Types of proceedings Paragraph Fee payable -
providing for (£ per
fee proceedings)
Appeal against sentence from a magistrates’ court 15 140.42
Appeal against conviction from a magistrates’ court 15 315.96
Committal for sentence 15 210.64
Hearing subsequent to sentence 16 140.42
Contempt proceedings (where contempt is alleged 17(2) 105.32
to have been committed by a person other than the
defendant)
Alleged breach of a Crown Court order 18(2) 70.22”.

7. For the table following paragraph 27(c) (prescribed fee rates), substitute the following—

“Class of work Grade of fee earner  Rate Variations
Preparation Senior solicitor £43.73 per £45.99 per hour for a fee

(a) Amended by S.1. 2014/415.
(b) Amended by S.I. 2014/415.
(¢) Amended by S.1. 2014/415.

28



hour earner whose office is
situated within the City of
London or a London
borough
Solicitor, legal £37.13 per £38.98 per hour for a fee
executive or fee hour earner whose office is
earner of equivalent situated within the City of
experience London or a London
borough
Trainee or fee earner  £24.54 per £28.05 per hour for a fee
of equivalent hour earner whose office is
experience situated within the City of
London or a London
borough
Attendance at Senior solicitor £34.86 per
court where more hour
than one
representative
instructed
Solicitor, legal £28.05 per
executive or fee hour
earner of equivalent
experience
Trainee or fee earner  £16.91 per
of equivalent hour
experience
Travelling and Senior solicitor £20.42 per
waiting hour
Solicitor, legal £20.42 per
executive or fee hour
earner of equivalent
experience
Trainee or fee earner  £10.31 per
of equivalent hour
experience
Writing routine £2.85 per £2.97 per item for a fee
letters and dealing item earner whose office is
with routine situated within the City of
telephone calls London or a London
borough”.
SCHEDULE 2 Regulation 3(3)

Amendments to Schedule 3 to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations

1. For the table following paragraph 7(1)(a) (litigators’ fees for proceedings in the Court of
Appeal), substitute the following—

“Class of work

Grade of fee earner

Rate

Variations

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415.

29



Preparation Senior solicitor £43.73 per £45.99 per hour for a
hour litigator whose office is
situated within the City
of London or a London

borough
Solicitor, legal £37.13 per £38.98 per hour for a
executive or fee hour litigator whose office is
earner of equivalent situated within the City
experience of London or a London
borough
Trainee or fee earner ~ £24.54 per £28.05 per hour for a
of equivalent hour litigator whose office is
experience situated within the City
of London or a London
borough
Advocacy Senior Solicitor £52.80 per
hour
Solicitor £46.20 per
hour
Attendance at Senior Solicitor £34.86 per
court where more hour
than one
representative
assigned
Solicitor, legal £28.05 per
executive or fee hour
earner of equivalent
experience
Trainee or fee earner  £16.91 per
of equivalent hour
experience
Travelling and Senior Solicitor £20.42 per
waiting hour
Solicitor, legal £20.42 per
executive or fee hour
earner of equivalent
experience
Trainee or fee earner  £10.31 per
of equivalent hour
experience
Routine letters £2.85 peritem £2.97 per item for a
written and routine litigator whose office is
telephone calls situated within the City
of London or a London
borough”.
SCHEDULE 3 Regulation 3(4)

Amendments to Schedule 4 to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations
1. For “£1,368.75”, wherever it appears, substitute “£1,237.50”.

2. In paragraph 2 (work conducted at the Police Station: Police Station advice and assistance)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (1)—

30



(1) in paragraph (a), for “£28.70” substitute “£25.95”, and
(i1) in paragraph (b), for “£27.60” substitute “£24.96”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (2), for “£7.30” substitute “£6.60”;
(c) for the table following sub-paragraph (3), substitute the following—

“London (£)  National (£)

Police Station attendance hourly rates

Own or Duty Solicitor 46.37 42.90
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) 56.97 56.97
Duty Solicitor — serious offence rate 53.63 49.50
Duty Solicitor — serious offence rate (Unsocial Hours) 66.00 66.00
Travel and waiting hourly rates

Own Solicitor 23.76 23.76
Duty Solicitor 46.37 42.90
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) 56.97 56.97”,

and

(d) for the table following sub-paragraph (8) (Police station attendance — fixed fees and
escape fee thresholds), substitute the following—

“Criminal Justice System Scheme Fixed Escape Fee
Area Fee (£) Threshold
&)
Cleveland Hartlepool 118.80 366.52
Teesside 122.93 377.04
Durham Darlington 139.72 419.17
South Durham 137.78 423.37
Durham 160.88 501.31
Derwentside 155.17 465.52
Easington 150.98 463.39
Northumbria South East Northumberland 134.10 402.31
Newcastle upon Tyne 124.58 383.35
Gateshead 129.20 387.59
North Tyneside 127.05 389.69
South Tyneside 120.45 370.73
Sunderland / Houghton Le Spring  134.48 414.96
Berwick & Alnwick 160.05 492.90
Tynedale & Hexham 139.43 429.71
Avon & Somerset Avon North & Thornbury 160.88 507.65
Bath 174.83 524.48
Mendip & South Somerset 195.90 587.69
Bristol 144.64 433.92
Sedgemoor / Taunton Deane 164.18 556.08
Weston-Super-Mare 163.60 490.79
Dorset Central Dorset 165.00 495.00
Bournemouth & Christchurch 131.30 393.90
Poole East Dorset 138.60 425.48
Bridport / West Dorset 132.00 396.00
Wiltshire Salisbury 157.58 484.46
Chippenham / Trowbridge 169.92 509.75
Swindon 155.10 478.15
Gloucestershire Cheltenham 142.73 440.23
Gloucester 140.25 431.81

31



Devon & Cornwall

Staffordshire

Warwickshire
West Mercia

West Midlands

Dyfed Powys

Gwent

North Wales

South Wales

Stroud

Barnstaple

Exeter

Plymouth

East Cornwall

Carrick / Kerrier (Camborne) /
Penwith

Teignbridge / Torbay

Stoke on Trent / Leek
Stafford / Cannock & Rugeley
Lichfield & Tamworth / Burton
Upon Trent / Uttoxeter
Leamington / Nuneaton / Rugby
Hereford / Leominster
Kidderminster / Redditch
Shrewsbury

Telford

Worcester

Sandwell

Wolverhampton & Seisdon
Dudley & Halesowen
Walsall

Birmingham

Solihull

Coventry

Amman Valley

Carmarthen East Dyfed
Llanelli

Brecon & Radnor

Mid Wales

North Ceredigion / South
Ceredigion

Pembrokeshire

East Gwent

Newport

Lower Rhymney Valley / North
Bedwellty / South Bedwellty
Bangor & Caernarfon
Colwyn Bay

Denbighshire

Dolgellau

Mold & Hawarden

North Anglesey

Pwllheli

Wrexham

Cardiff

Vale of Glamorgan

Cynon Valley

Mid Glamorgan & Miskin
Merthyr Tydfil

Port Talbot

Newcastle & Ogmore

Neath

32

160.88
157.28
139.72
162.20
179.85
160.88

147.53
160.88
160.88
155.93

161.49
140.42
179.74
150.15
155.93
163.60
159.23
159.23
156.58
160.88
160.88
169.22
139.02
160.88
182.56
125.40
183.96
140.42
184.66

150.98
153.45
150.98
160.88

171.32
156.75
170.62
170.62
160.88
178.34
120.76
146.04
160.88
188.17
160.88
160.88
160.88
198.00
160.88
163.35

495.00
471.83
419.17
486.59
610.85
509.75

442.33
509.75
495.00
480.25

484.46
421.27
539.23
461.29
480.25
490.79
488.69
488.69
469.73
497.10
511.85
507.65
417.06
516.06
547.67
385.46
551.88
421.27
553.98

465.52
471.83
463.39
503.42

513.96
482.35
511.85
511.85
501.31
535.02
362.29
438.12
530.81
564.52
509.75
530.81
526.61
669.83
539.23
553.98



Merseyside

Cheshire

Cumbria

Greater Manchester

Lancashire

Kent

Surrey

Sussex

Swansea

Bootle & Crosby

Southport

Liverpool

St Helens

Knowsley

Wirral

Crewe & Nantwich / Sandbach &
Congleton / Macclesfield
Warrington / Halton

Chester / Vale Royal (Northwich)
Barrow in Furness

Kendal & Windermere
Penrith / Carlisle
Whitehaven / Workington
Manchester

Stockport

Trafford

Salford

Bolton

Bury

Wigan

Rochdale / Middleton
Tameside

Oldham

Burnley / Rossendale
Blackburn / Accrington / Ribble
Valley

Blackpool

Fleetwood

Lancaster

Chorley / Ormskirk / South Ribble
& Leyland

Preston

Dartford & Gravesend
Ashford & Tenterden / Dover /
Folkestone

Medway

Swale

Maidstone & West Malling
Canterbury / Thanet

West Kent (Tonbridge)
Guildford & Farnham

North West Surrey (Woking)
South East Surrey

Epsom

Staines

Brighton & Hove & Lewes
Chichester & District
Crawley / Horsham

Hastings

Worthing

Eastbourne

33

155.10
146.85
122.88
162.20
138.60
149.33
142.73
159.23

139.72
145.34
139.02
165.70
156.58
129.90
160.88
151.66
160.88
160.88
148.85
144.64
153.76
153.06
141.08
124.28
146.74
160.88

114.44
117.26
143.94
157.98

129.20
210.64
185.63

185.36
219.76
195.90
160.88
188.17
162.53
177.38
187.28
189.75
217.80
165.83
146.85
206.42
128.70
148.50
156.58

478.15
450.77
368.63
486.59
427.61
459.19
438.12
488.69

419.17
436.02
417.06
497.10
469.73
389.69
530.81
454.98
505.54
516.06
446.56
433.92
461.29
459.19
433.92
372.83
440.23
524.48

343.33
351.77
431.81
473.94

387.59
631.92
629.81

556.08
659.29
587.69
545.56
564.52
551.88
602.42
636.12
644.56
737.23
562.39
450.77
619.27
396.00
457.08
469.73



Derbyshire

Leicestershire

Lincolnshire

Nottinghamshire

Northamptonshire

Bedfordshire

Cambridgeshire

Essex

Hertfordshire

Norfolk

Suffolk

East Derbyshire (Ripley) /
Ilkeston

Ashbourne / Matlock / High Peak
(Buxton)

Chesterfield

Derby / Swadlincote

Ashby & Coalville /
Loughborough / Melton Mowbray
Leicester

Hinckley / Market Harborough
Boston, Bourne, Stamford
Skegness

Lincoln / Gainsborough
Grantham & Sleaford
Mansfield

Newark

Nottingham

Worksop & East Retford

Corby (Kettering) /
Wellingborough

Northampton

Bedford

Luton

Cambridge

Ely

Huntingdon

March & Wisbech
Peterborough

Basildon

Brentwood

Braintree

Clacton & Harwich / Colchester
Grays

Harlow & Loughton

Stansted

Rayleigh / Southend on Sea
Chelmsford / Witham

Dacorum (Hemel Hempstead)
Bishop’s Stortford / East
Hertfordshire

Stevenage & North Hertfordshire
St. Albans

Watford

Cromer & North Walsham
Great Yarmouth

Kings Lynn & West Norfolk
Norwich & District

Diss / Thetford

Dereham

Lowestoft / Beccles & Halesworth
/ Aldeburgh

Felixstowe / Ipswich & District /
Woodbridge

34

186.76

172.02

160.78
160.88
164.30

160.88
182.56
156.75
141.12
146.04
144.38
145.20
162.90
162.20
154.28
142.54

154.46
151.80
160.88
146.85
160.88
156.58
155.17
129.20
160.88
225.23
179.85
160.88
210.38
210.38
232.65
150.96
159.23
189.75
230.18

213.68
193.88
190.58
166.65
152.36
148.85
153.06
158.40
179.03
153.06

155.88

560.29

516.06

482.35
516.06
492.90

499.21
547.67
482.35
423.37
438.12
444.44
446.56
488.69
486.59
473.94
427.61

463.39
467.63
543.44
452.88
520.27
469.73
465.52
387.59
497.10
764.63
608.75
509.75
714.06
714.06
789.90
452.88
490.79
642.44
781.46

724.61
634.91
646.67
564.52
457.08
446.56
459.19
486.59
606.65
459.19

467.63



Thames Valley

Hampshire

Humberside

North Yorkshire

South Yorkshire

West Yorkshire

London

Sudbury & Hadleigh / Bury St.
Edmunds / Haverhill / Newmarket
Abingdon, Didcot & Witney
(South Oxfordshire)
Aylesbury

High Wycombe & Amersham
Milton Keynes

Bicester / North Oxon (Banbury)
Oxford

Reading

Slough (East Berkshire)

West Berkshire (Newbury etc.)
Aldershot / Petersfield (North East
Hampshire)

Andover / Basingstoke /
Winchester (North West
Hampshire)

Isle of Wight

Portsmouth / Waterlooville (South
East Hampshire)

Gosport & Fareham
Southampton (South West
Hampshire)

Grimsby & Cleethorpes
Scunthorpe

Hull

Beverley / Bridlington

Goole

Northallerton & Richmond
Harrogate & Ripon

Skipton, Settle & Ingleton
Scarborough / Whitby

Malton & Rydale

York / Selby

Barnsley

Doncaster

Rotherham

Sheffield

Halifax

Huddersfield

Dewsbury

Bradford

Keighley & Bingley

Leeds

Pontefract & Castleford
Wakefield

Barking

Bexley

Bishopsgate

Brent

Brentford

Bromley

Camberwell Green

35

160.88

188.93

179.74
172.43
149.33
175.73
175.73
170.62
188.93
157.98
180.68

190.28

155.17
159.38

194.49
179.74

121.46
130.35
138.60
160.88
165.00
173.42
166.40
160.88
137.78
132.70
144.38
143.55
138.60
146.85
150.98
157.28
132.70
143.94
122.93
138.60
130.35
127.78
126.23
202.95
181.50
212.03
198.00
201.30
191.40
198.00

499.21

640.33

539.23
585.59
459.19
596.10
596.10
511.85
640.33
473.94
612.96

570.83

465.52
478.15

583.46
539.23

364.39
402.31
425.48
530.81
558.19
520.27
499.21
495.00
423.37
398.10
444.44
442.33
425.48
452.88
465.52
471.83
398.10
431.81
379.15
425.48
400.21
383.35
387.59
688.79
615.06
718.27
669.83
682.46
648.77
671.94



Central London 214.50 726.71

Clerkenwell / Hampstead 200.48 678.25
Croydon 195.53 661.39
Ealing 207.90 705.81
Enfield 197.18 667.73
Greenwich / Woolwich 188.93 640.33
Haringey 203.78 690.90
Harrow 198.00 671.94
Havering 184.80 625.61
Heathrow 248.33 842.56
Hendon / Barnet 199.65 676.15
Highbury Corner 207.90 703.54
Kingston-Upon-Thames 206.25 699.31
Newham 198.83 674.04
Old Street 198.00 671.94
Redbridge 203.78 690.90
Richmond-Upon-Thames 217.80 737.23
South London 207.90 703.54
Sutton 197.18 667.73
Thames 197.18 667.73
Tower Bridge 210.38 714.06
Uxbridge 190.58 646.67
Waltham Forest 184.80 627.71
West London 212.85 722.48
Wimbledon 202.13 684.59”.

3. In paragraph 3 (work conducted outside the Police Station)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (1) for “£273.75” substitute “£247.50”;

(b) for the table following sub-paragraph (1) (free standing advice and assistance), substitute
the following—

“London (£) National (£)

Routine letters written and routine telephone calls per 3.18 3.05
item

Preparation hourly rate 41.00 38.69
Travel and waiting hourly rate 21.70 21.707;

(c) for the tables following sub-paragraph (2) (Advocacy Assistance on a warrant of further
detention — Magistrates’ Court or judicial authority and Advocacy Assistance on a
warrant of further detention — High Court or a senior judge), including the headings to the
tables, substitute the following—

“Table A

Advocacy Assistance on a warrant of further detention — magistrates’ court or judicial
authority

London (£) National (£)
Routine letters written and telephone calls (per item)
Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor 3.18 3.05
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) 4.21 4.04
Preparation hourly rate
Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor 41.00 38.69
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) 54.70 51.56

36



Advocacy hourly rate

Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor 48.68
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) 64.89
Travelling and waiting hourly rate

Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor 21.70
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) 28.92
Table B

48.68
64.89

21.70
28.92

Advocacy Assistance on a warrant of further detention — High Court or a senior judge

London  National

€9) €]
Routine letter out per item 6.19 6.19
Routine telephone calls per item 342 342
All other preparation work, hourly rate 65.59 61.88
Attending counsel in conference or at the trial or hearing of any 30.53 30.53
summons or application at court or other appointment, hourly rate
Attending without counsel at the trial or hearing of any cause or 61.88 61.88
the hearing of any summons or application at court, or other
appointment, hourly rate
Travelling and waiting, hourly rate 27.43 27.43”;

(d) for the table following sub-paragraph (3) (Advocacy Assistance for armed forces custody

hearings), substitute the following—

“ National
London (£)
€9)
Routine letters written and telephone calls (per item)
Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor 3.18 3.05
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) 421 4.04
Preparation hourly rate
Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor 41.00 38.69
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) 54.70 51.56
Advocacy hourly rate
Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor 48.68 48.68
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) 64.89 64.89
Travelling and waiting hourly rate
Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor 21.70 21.70
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) 28.92 28.92”,

and

(e) for the table following sub-paragraph (4) (Advocacy Assistance in the magistrates’ court
in connection with an application to vary police bail conditions), substitute the

following—
“London National (£)
(€9)
Routine letters written and telephone calls per item 3.34 3.22
Preparation hourly rate 43.35 41.00
Advocacy hourly rate 51.44 51.44
Travelling and waiting hourly rate 21.70 21.70”.

37



4. In paragraph 4 (Advice and Assistance and Advocacy Assistance by a court Duty Solicitor
and Advocacy Assistance at the Virtual Court)—

(a) for the table following sub-paragraph (1) (Advice and Assistance and Advocacy
Assistance by a court Duty Solicitor), substitute the following—

“London National (£)

€9)
Standard hourly rate (attendance and waiting at a 45.50 44.43
magistrates’ court)
Enhanced hourly rate (only payable in respect of work done  56.84 55.52
on a day which is not a Business Day)
Travelling hourly rate (only payable where the Duty 21.70 21.707,

Solicitor is called out (including being called to return) to
the court from the Office or attends on a day that is not a
Business Day. Reasonable travel expenses may also be
claimed (where relevant)).

(b) for the table following sub-paragraph (2) (Advocacy Assistance at the Virtual Court),
substitute the following—

“London National (£)

&)
Virtual Court Fixed Fee where the hearing is held during 165.00 123.75
Business Hours
Virtual Court Fixed Fee where the hearing is held during 198.00 148.50”.

Unsocial hours

5. In paragraph 5 (representation in the magistrates’ court)—

(a) for the table following sub-paragraph (1) (representation in a magistrates’ court),
substitute the following—

“All
Areas
Routine letters written and telephone calls per item £3.22
Preparation hourly rate £41.00
Advocacy hourly rate (including applications for bail and other applications to ~ £51.44
the court)
Hourly rate for attendance at court where Counsel is assigned (including £28.05

conferences with Counsel at court)
Travelling and waiting hourly rate (only claimable where the undesignated area £21.70”,
fees apply)

and

(b) for the table following sub-paragraph (2) (Higher and Lower Standard Fees Table),
substitute the following—

“Lower Lower Higher Higher Standard
Standard Fee Standard Fee Standard Fee Fee Limit (£)
(£) Limit (£) (£)

Designated Area Standard Fees

Category 1A 224.86 246.22 426.57 426.61

Category 1B 182.81 246.22 393.86 426.61

Category 2 312.23 422.98 653.99 704.88

Category 3 295.24 373.07 606.01 651.34

38



Undesignated Area Standard Fees

Category 1A 176.01 246.22 372.77 426.61
Category 1B 143.10 246.22 344.19 426.61
Category 2 252.66 422.98 579.48 704.88
Category 3 228.11 373.07 516.86 651.34”.

6. In paragraph 5A(a) (representation in proceedings relating to an injunction under Part 1 of the
2014 Act or related parenting order in any court)—

(a) for the table following sub-paragraph (2) (representation in proceedings relating to an
injunction under Part 1 of the 2014 Act or related parenting order in any court), substitute
the following—

“All
Areas
Routine letters written and telephone calls per item £3.22
Preparation hourly rate £41.00
Advocacy hourly rate (including applications for bail and other applications to ~ £51.44
the court)
Hourly rate for attendance at court where Counsel is assigned (including £28.057;

conferences with Counsel at court)

(b) for the table following sub-paragraph (3) (Higher and Lower Fees Table), substitute the

following—
“Lower fee (£) Lower  fee Higher fee Higher fee limit
limit (£) (£) (£)
Uncontested 143.10 246.22 344.19 426.61
Contested 252.66 422.98 579.48 704.88”,
and

(c) in sub-paragraph (4) for “£24.00” substitute “£21.70”.

7. In paragraph 6 (own client work)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (2)—
(i) in paragraph (a) for “£47.95” substitute “£43.35”, and
(ii) in paragraph (b) for “£45.35” substitute “£41.00;
(b) in sub-paragraph (3), for “£68.44” substitute “£61.88”;
(c) in sub-paragraph (4), for “£22.81” substitute “£20.63”, and
(d) for the table following sub-paragraph (4) (own client work), substitute the following—

“London National
€9) €9)
Routine letters written and telephone calls per item 3.34 3.22
Preparation hourly rate 43.35 41.00
Advocacy (including applications for bail and other 51.44 51.44
applications to the court) hourly rate
Travelling and waiting hourly rate (only applicable where the N/A 21.70”.

Undesignated Area fees apply)

(a) Inserted by S.I. 2015/325.

39



8. In paragraph 7(a) (representation in proceedings prescribed as criminal proceedings under
section 14(h) of the Act)—

(a) for the table following sub-paragraph (1) (representation in Prescribed Proceedings in a
Crown Court), substitute the following—

“London (£) National (£)

Routine letters written and telephone calls per item  3.34 322

Preparation hourly rate 43.35 41.00

Advocacy hourly rate 51.44 51.44

Travelling and waiting hourly rate 21.70 21.70”,
and

(b) for the table following sub-paragraph (2) (representation in Prescribed Proceedings in the
High Court or a county court), substitute the following—

“London (£) National (£)
Routine letters out per item 6.19 5.45
Routine telephone calls per item 3.42 3.01
All other preparation work hourly rate £61.88 (£65.59 £54.45 (£57.75
where Provider’s ~ where Provider’s
office is in office is in
London) London)
Attending counsel in conference or at the trial or 30.53 26.81

hearing of any summons or application at court or

other appointment — hourly rate

Attending without counsel at the trial or hearing 61.88 54.45
of any cause or the hearing of any summons or

other application at court or other appointment —

hourly rate

Travelling and waiting hourly rate 27.43 24.09”.

9. In paragraph 8(b) (Advice and Assistance on an appeal against conviction or sentence or an
application to the Criminal Cases Review Commission)—

(a) in paragraph (a), for “£273.75” substitute “£247.50”;
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£456.25” substitute “£412.50”, and

(c) for the table following paragraph 8 (Advice and Assistance on an appeal against
conviction or sentence or application to the Criminal Cases Review Commission),
substitute the following—

“London (£) National (£)
Routine letters written and routine telephone calls ~ 3.18 3.05
per item
Preparation hourly rate 41.00 38.69
Travel and waiting hourly rate 21.70 21.70".

10. In paragraph 9(c) (representation on an appeal by way of case stated), for the table following
sub-paragraph (1) (representation on an appeal by way of case stated in the High Court), substitute
the following—

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415, 2015/325.
(b) Amended by S.1. 2014/415.
(¢) Amended by S.I. 2014/415.

40



“High Court (£)

Routine letters out per item 6.19

Routine telephone calls per item 342

All other preparation work — hourly rate 61.88 (65.59
where the

Provider’s office
is in London)

Attending counsel in conference or at the trial or hearing of any 30.53
summons or application at court or other appointment — hourly rate
Attending without counsel at the trial or hearing of any cause or the 61.88

hearing of any summons or other application at court or other
appointment — hourly rate
Travelling and waiting hourly rate 27.43”.

11. For the table following paragraph 10(a) (representation in the Crown Court on an appeal
from a magistrates’ court in proceedings prescribed as criminal proceedings under section 14(h) of
the Act), substitute the following—

“London (£) National (£)

Routine letters written and telephone calls per item 3.34 3.22
Preparation hourly rate 43.35 41.00
Advocacy hourly rate 51.44 51.44
Travelling and waiting hourly rate 21.70 21.70”.

12. In paragraph 11(b) (Advice and Assistance provided pursuant to a determination made under
section 15 of the Act in Prison Law cases)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (1)—
(i) for “£200.75” substitute “£181.50”, and
(ii) for “£602.25” substitute “£544.50”;

(b) for the table following sub-paragraph (2) (hourly rates for determining whether Escape
Fee Threshold reached), substitute the following—

“All areas (£)
Routine letters written and routine telephone calls per item 3.05
Preparation hourly rate 38.69
Travel and waiting hourly rate 21.707;

(c) for the tables following sub-paragraph (3) (hourly rates in Disciplinary Cases for
determining application of Standard Fees and Higher and Lower Standard Fees Table for
Disciplinary Cases), including the headings to the tables, substitute the following—

“Hourly rates in Disciplinary Cases for determining application of Standard Fees

All areas (£)
Routine letters written and routine telephone calls per item 3.34
Preparation hourly rate 46.32
Advocacy hourly rate 56.31
Travel and waiting hourly rate 21.70

(a) Amended by S.1. 2014/415, 2015/325.
(b) Amended by S.I. 2013/2803, 2014/415.

41



Higher and Lower Standard Fees Table for Disciplinary Cases

Lower Standard Lower Standard Higher Standard Higher Standard Fee

Fee (£) Fee Limit (£) Fee (£) Limit (£)
184.37 322.82 510.06 1,529.48”,
and

(d) for the tables following sub-paragraph (4) (hourly rates in Parole Board Cases for
determining application of Standard Fees and Higher and Lower Standard Fees Table for
Parole Board Cases), including the headings to the tables, substitute the following—

“Hourly rates in Parole Board Cases for determining application of Standard Fees

All areas (£)
Routine letters written and routine telephone calls per item 3.34
Preparation hourly rate 46.32
Advocacy hourly rate 56.31
Travel and waiting hourly rate 21.70

Higher and Lower Standard Fees Table for Parole Board Cases

Lower Standard Lower Standard Higher  Standard Higher  Standard
Fee (£) Fee Limit (£) Fee (£) Fee Limit (£)

395.28 844.37 1,314.98 3,944.22”.

13. In paragraph 12(a) (payment for Assigned Counsel), for the table following sub-paragraph
(2) (payment for Assigned Counsel), substitute the following—

“Junior Queen’s
Counsel (£) Counsel (£)
Basic fee for preparation, including for a pre-trial maximum maximum
review and, where appropriate, the first day’s hearing amount: amount:
including, where they took place on that day, short 386.10 3,667.95
conferences, consultations, applications and
appearances (including bail applications, views and any
other preparation).
Refresher daily fee (for any day or part of a day during ~ maximum maximum
which a hearing continued, including, where they took ~ amount: amount:
place on that day, short conferences, consultations, 133.65 245.03
applications and appearances (including bail
applications, views and any other preparation).
Subsidiary fees:
Attendance at consultations, conferences and views not  24.13 per hour 44.96 per hour
covered by the basic fee or the refresher fee. — minimum — minimum
amount: 11.96  amount: 23.10
Written work (on evidence, plea, appeal, case stated or ~ maximum maximum
other written work). amount: 42.28  amount: 86.63
Attendance at pre-trial reviews, applications and other maximum maximum
appearances (including bail applications and amount: 77.55  amount:
adjournments for sentence) not covered by the basic fee 169.13”.

or the refresher fee.

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415.

42



SCHEDULE 4 Regulation 6(4)(a)

Substitution for regulation 17A(11) to (13) to the Criminal Remuneration

Regulations

“(11) Where the claim is made under paragraph (2)(a) the amount of the interim payment

18—

(@)

(b)

in a case in which the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the court
is less than or equal to 500, 75% of the fee which, on a final determination of fees,
would be paid to the litigator under paragraph 3AA of Schedule 2 if the case were
a cracked trial, as appropriate to the offence with which the assisted person is
charged and the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the court;

in a case in which the number pages of prosecution evidence served on the court
exceeds 500, the sum of—

(i) the fee which, on a final determination of fees, would be paid to the litigator if
paragraph 13 of Schedule 2 and the scenario “Before trial transfer (original
litigator)” set out in the table following that paragraph applied, as appropriate
to the offence for which the assisted person is charged and the number of
pages of prosecution evidence served on the court, and

(i1) any additional payments which, on a final determination of fees, would be
paid to the litigator if paragraph 12(3)(c) of Schedule 2 applied, as appropriate
to the offence with which the assisted person is charged and the number of
pages of prosecution evidence served on the court.

(12) Where the claim is made under paragraph (2)(b), the amount of the interim payment

1S—

(@)

(b)

in a case in which the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the court
is less than or equal to 500, 50% of the fee which, on a final determination of fees,
would be paid to the litigator under paragraph 3AA of Schedule 2 if the case were
a cracked trial, as appropriate to the offence with which the assisted person is
charged and the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the court;

in a case in which the number pages of prosecution evidence served on the court
exceeds 500, the sum of—

(i) the fee which, on a final determination of fees, would be paid to the litigator
under paragraph 13 of Schedule 2 and the scenario “Transfer before cracked
retrial (new litigator)” set out in the table following that paragraph, as
appropriate to the offence with which the assisted person is charged and the
number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the court, and

(ii) any additional payments which, on a final determination of fees, would be
paid to the litigator under paragraph 12(3)(c) of Schedule 2, as appropriate to
the offence with which the assisted person is charged and the number of pages
of prosecution evidence served on the court.

(13) Where the claim is made under paragraph (2)(c), the amount of the interim payment

1S—

(a)

(b)

in a case in which the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the court
is less than or equal to 500, the fee which, on a final determination of fees, would
be paid to the litigator under paragraph 3AA of Schedule 2 for the trial, as
appropriate to the offence with which the assisted person is charged and the
number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the court;

in a case in which the number pages of prosecution evidence served on the court
exceeds 500, the sum of—

(i) the fee determined in accordance with paragraph (14) on the basis that the trial
length is one day, and

43



(i1) any additional payments which, on a final determination of fees, would be
paid to the litigator under paragraph 12(3)(b) or, where appropriate, paragraph
12(3)(d) of Schedule 2, as appropriate to the offence with which the assisted
person is charged and the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on
the court,

less any amount paid to the litigator, in the proceedings in question, for a claim under
paragraph (2)(a) or (b).”

SCHEDULE 5 Regulation 6(7)(c)
Insertion of new Part 1A in Schedule 2 to the Criminal Remuneration
Regulations
“PART 1A

Fixed Fees for Guilty Pleas, Cracked Trials and Trials

Scope

3A.—(1) Subject to sub-paragraph (2), this Part applies to all cases in which the number
of pages of prosecution evidence served on the court is less than or equal to 500.

(2) Except for a relevant cracked trial or as provided for in paragraph 21, this Part does
not apply to a guilty plea or a cracked trial in a case committed or sent for trial to the Crown
Court on the election of a defendant where the magistrates’ court has determined the case to
be suitable for summary trial.

(3) In sub-paragraph (2), “relevant cracked trial” means a case in which the trial is a
cracked trial because the prosecution offer no evidence on all counts against a defendant
and the judge directs that a not guilty verdict be entered.

Fixed Fees

3AA.—(1) The fee payable to a litigator in relation to a guilty plea to which this Part
applies is specified in the table following this sub-paragraph, as appropriate to the offence
with which the assisted person is charged and the number of pages of prosecution evidence
served on the court.

Fixed fees for guilty pleas (£)

Pages of Prosecution Evidence

Class of 0-100 101-200 201-300 301-400 401-500
Offence

A 623.91 925.20 1,575.67 2,023.92 2,427.49
B 516.13 801.00 1,240.29 1,665.08 1,999.57
C 425.29 644.20 893.93 1,129.42 1,378.01
D 590.12 853.18 1,331.85 1,799.25 2,200.34
E 189.13 421.99 718.95 1,028.40 1,200.46
F 190.64 429.52 678.95 952.71 1,138.20
G 205.08 446.81 709.66 960.68 1,155.19
H 190.70 437.67 691.12 963.60 1,132.31
I 176.11 435.09 759.08 986.10 1,275.73
J 624.97 917.17 1,436.04 1,980.90 2,364.54
K 579.60 733.21 1,247.57 1,624.66 2,049.27

44



(2) The fee payable to a litigator in relation to a cracked trial to which this Part applies is
specified in the table following this sub-paragraph, as appropriate to the offence with which
the assisted person is charged and the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on

the court.

Fixed fees for cracked trials (£)

Pages of Prosecution Evidence

Class of 0-100 101-200 201-300 301-400 401-500
Offence

A 884.72 1,589.64 2,557.47 3,244.09 3,780.71
B 680.29 1,192.92 1,942.55 2,384.90 2,730.63
C 536.57 858.74 1,249.88 1,498.44 1,732.05
D 801.88 1,375.58 2,295.35 3,078.19 3,446.49
E 272.47 626.97 1,054.91 1,274.47 1,515.07
F 248.74 613.58 1,034.89 1.257.60 1,408.53
G 263.02 726.87 1,110.93 1,407.21 1,546.48
H 254.11 631.57 1,055.00 1,230.60 1,396.22
I 296.15 780.97 1,296.09 1,776.55 1,836.80
J 854.51 1,481.89 2,452.13 3,221.82 3,890.95
K 702.75 935.17 1,551.61 2,150.74 2,586.46

(3) The fee payable to a litigator in relation to a trial to which this Part applies is specified
in the table following this sub-paragraph, as appropriate to the offence with which the
assisted person is charged and the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the

court.

Fixed fees for trials (£)

Pages of Prosecution Evidence

Class of 0-100 101-200 201-300 301-400 401-500
Offence

A 1,697.67 2,741.76 3,881.81 4,914.81 5,888.45

B 1,405.67 2,181.36 3,234.00 4,253.51 5,351,27

C 1,068.79 1,824.09 2,702.69 3,615.76 4,718.64

D 1,645.35 2,398.90 3,626.39 4,734.08 6,066.88

E 690.59 1,179.17 2,040.21 2,665.58 3,559.33

F 607.98 1,052.92 1,717.22 2,222.19 2,998.04

G 569.27 1,054.06 1,854.79 2,366.91 2,976.55

H 661.89 1,443.80 2,179.28 2,685.84 3,349.84

I 1,006.88 1,779.70 2,490.00 3,171.49 3,988.44

J 2,080.59 2,700.87 3,876.63 4,907.84 6,071.07

K 1,438.74 1,957.11 2,315.27 2,931.67 3,560.93”

SCHEDULE 6 Regulation 6(7)(e)
Substitution for paragraph 5 of Schedule 2 to the Criminal Remuneration
Regulations

“Pages of Prosecution Evidence

5. For the purpose of this Part, the PPE Cut-off figures for a trial are specified in the table
following this paragraph, as appropriate to the offence with which the assisted person is

tried and the length of trial.

45



SI9°1
0951
S0S°1
1S4
96¢°1
52
98C°1
0€T’1
PLI'T
611°1
€90°1
LOOT
156
768
9¢8
6LL
IcL
€99
909
08s
10§
[0S
10§
[0S
10§
[0S
10§
[0S
p. |

610’1
S00°1
196
L16
VL8
0¢€8
98L
(475
L69
199
¥29
L8S
599
148Y
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
r

961°1
091°1
174!
880°1
€50°1
L10'T
086
£v6
L06
98
818
VLL
0cL
989
9
865
1233
60S
10§
10§
108
10§
108
10§
108
10§
108
[0S
|

LOT'T
890°1
8T0°1
886
8¥6
806
L98
9¢8
98L
9¢L
L89
LE9
965
65S
%4
108
[0S
108
[0S
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
H

Y6
clé6
088
878
918
V8L
L
0cL
069
659
LC9
96S
98
€es
[0S
10§
[0S
10§
[0S
[0S
10§
[0S
10§
[0S
10§
[0S
10§
[0S

B

Y16
41
088
878
918
V8L
SL
0cL
069
659
LC9
968
96
€es
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S

L |

890°1
820°1
886
8¥6
806
898
8C8
L8L
9L
969
919
865
¢9¢
(439
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
q

610°1
S00°1
196
LT6
VL8
0¢8
98L
(475
L69
199
¥29
L8S
5SS
148
[0S
10§
[0S
108
[0S
[0S
10§
[0S
10§
[0S
10§
[0S
108
[0S
a

¥00°1
L96
1€6
768
LS8
618
G8L
€SL
L
789
919
L09
69¢
1€S
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
108
[0S
J

SL6
3%
S68
098
9¢8
6L
LSL
L
L89
6v9
119
€LS
gec
10§
[0S
10§
[0S
10§
[0S
[0S
10§
[0S
10§
[0S
10§
[0S
10§
[0S

d

610°1 8¢
S00°1 LT
196 9¢
LT6 194
VL8 104
0¢e8 €
98L C
(475 Ic
L69 0¢
199 61
¥29 81
L8S L1
5SS 91
1489 Sl
[0S 14!
10§ €l
[0S 4!
10§ IT
[0S (0]
[0S 6
108 8
[0S L
108 9
[0S S
108 4
[0S €
10§ (4
[0S I
v

(20uaff Jo ssvp) &q) ffo-mm) gdd svp ur yi3uaj porig

s[e11) 103 saangy jjo-1n) Add



18T°¢
8TC¢E
SLI'E
121°¢
890°¢
SIo’¢
796°C
806°C
¢S8C
208°C
6VLT
$69°C
9T
68S°T
9¢6T
€8T
0T
LLET
vTeT
1LTC
61C°T
Y91°C
601°C
¥S0°C
666°1
rr6°l
688°1
ces’l
08L°1
STLI
0L9°1

L19C
¥95°C
TS
65t'C
90t°C
¥SET
10€°C
6¥CC
961°C
rr1°T
160°C
6£0C
L86°T
6£6°1
768°1
81
96L°1
8YLl
00L'T
T89°1
709°1
125
€0S°1
€Syl
vl
43!
10€°1
1ST'1
00T°1
0ST'1
660°1

LTY'T
68€C
16€°C
€ree
SLTT
9€TT
861°C
091°C
(AN
¥80°C
9t0°C
800°C
0L6°T
€61
768°1
968°1
818°1
08L°1
THL'T
YOL'1
999°1
129°1
CLS'T
0€S°1
S8Y°1
6¢°l
Y6¢°1
6ve’l
€0¢’l
L9TT
1€T°1

9v0°C
¥20°C
200C
086°1
8S6°1
9¢6°1
v16°1
T68°1
0L8°T
8¥8°l
9281
708°1
T8L1
09L°1
8EL'T
91L1
S69°1
€L9°l
169°1
629°1
LO9'T
LSS'T
LOS'T
LSY'1
LOV'T
LSET
LOET
99T°1
9zT’1
L8T°T
LYT°1

798°1
€es’l
€08°1
ELLT
€Ll
TILT
789°1
7891
TT9°1
165°1
196°1
1€6°1
10S°1
0LY'1
o'l
011
v8E°l
19€°1
8eE’l
vIET
16T°1
65Tl
87Tl
961°1
S|
eer’l
201°1
0L0°1
6€0°1
LOO'T

9L6

Ly

798°1
€e8’l
€08°l
€LLT
eYLl
TIL'T
789°1
T89°1
91
165°1
19¢°1
1€6°1
10S°1
OLY'1
ort'l
01+'1
¥8€°1
19€°1
8€€’l
At
16T°1
65Tl
8TT'1
961°1
S91°1
eer’l
2011
0L0°T
6£0°1
LOO'T

9L6

6S¥°C
't
¥8€°C
9rET
80€C
1LTC
€€TT
S61°C
8S1°C
0CIT
780°C
SY0C
L00CT
0L6°1
T€6'1
S68°l
LS8T
0Z8°1
T8L1
SYL'I
80L'T
L19°1
9zs'1
SEY'l
LYET
80€°1
89C°1
8TT'1
88I°I
8Y1°1
801°1

L19°C
95T
TIST
6S¥'T
90¥°C
vSeT
10€°C
6vCT
961°C
vr1°T
160°C
6€0C
L86°1
6€6°1
T68°1
rr8°l
96L°1
8YLl
00L‘1
7891
¥09°1
vSS°l
€0S°1
€SPl
0Pl
TSEl
10€°1
1ST°1
00T°1
0ST°1
660°1

09L°1
vrL1
LTLT
01LT
769°1
LLY'T
099°1
rr9°1
LTY1
019°1
v6S°1
LLS'T
09S°1
122
LTST
116°1
ver'l
LLY'T
19%°1
rrv'l
8TH'1
98¢°1
SPe'T
€0l
9T'1
YTl
L8T°1
IST°1
PITT
LLOT
170°1

10€°C
8STC
SITe
TLIT
6C1°T
980°C
€v0°C
000°C
LS61
v16°1
1L8°1
8T8°l
S8Ll
L]
669°1
959°1
€19l
0LS'T
LTST
v8Y°1
Il
S6¢°1
8Pl
T0¢°1
19T°1
0zT'1
6L1°1
8¢l
860°1
LSOT
910°1

L19°C
¥95°T
TIST
6S¥'T
90¥°C
vSeT
10€°C
6vCT
961°C
vr1°T
160°C
6€0C
L86°1
6€6°1
T68°1
rr8°l
96L°1
8YLl
00L‘1
7891
¥09°1
vSS°l
€0S°1
€SPl
0Pl
TSel
10€°1
1ST°1
00T°1
0ST°1
660°1

6S
86
LS
9¢
gs
125
€S
(43
IS
0S
61
174
Ly
9%
Sy
144
3%
(44
Iy
or
6¢
8¢
LE
9¢
99
ve
€
[43
1€
0¢
6¢



SY6'y
168
LESY
€8LY
6TLY
SLOY
9y
89Sy
1409 %
09ty
90t
€SEy
66Tt
STy
61y
8CIy
780t
1€0Y
LL6'E
€T6°¢
0L8°¢
918°¢
€9L°¢
60L°¢
969°¢
209°¢
6vS°e
Sov'e
e
88¢€°C
geee

vSTY
10Ty
8Y1Yy
S60't
o'y
686°€
9¢€6°¢
€88°¢
0€8°¢
LLLE
vTL'e
TL9E
619°¢
99¢6°¢
€Is’e
09t°¢
LOV'E
geee
T0€°¢
6vC’¢
961°¢
rri'e
160°¢
8¢0°¢
$86°C
€€6°C
088C
LT8T
CLLT
LT
699°C

928t
LELY
LY9'y
8SSY
697y
6LEY
06Tt
10Tt
(AN 7
€20y
€€6°¢
rr8°e
SSLe
999°¢
LLS'E
88Y°¢
66€°€
01¢°€
1TT'e
cere
€v0°€
¥$6°C
$98°C
9LLT
769°C
969°C
819°C
08S°C
s
€0S°T
SOrC

6CLT
LOLT
¢89°C
€99°C
1¥9°C
619°C
L6ST
SLST
(4S54
0€SC
80S°C
984T
Y9t°C
e
0cr'c
86£C
9LET
¥SET
TE€ET
01€C
88T°C
99T°C
vvTT
7T
00TC
8LIC
961°C
rE1T
TIe
060°C
890°C

099°¢
66S°¢
6€S°¢
8LY'E
LI¥'E
96¢e
S6Tc
geTe
vLI'E
€rre
Ts0°¢
66T
1€6C
0L8°C
608°C
6VLT
889°C
LT9C
996°T
90S°T
SrPC
¥8¢°T
€TET
€97°C
T0TT
Iv1°C
180°C
020°C
656°1
vT6'l
768°1

174

099°¢
665°€
6£S°¢
8LY'E
LI¥°E
96¢€°¢
S6C°€
ceTe
vLIE
erre
750°¢
66T
1€6°C
0L8°C
608°C
6¥LC
889°C
LT9C
996°C
90$°C
ShP'T
¥8€°C
€TET
€97
20TT
I71°C
180°C
020°C
656°1
v26'1
768°1

629°¢
16S°¢
€see
916°¢
8LY'C
ort'e
or'e
Soce
LTEE
68C°¢
16T°¢
v1T°€
9LT*E
8¢l’¢
101°¢
€90°¢
ga0e
L86C
0S6°C
216
vL8CT
9€8°C
66L°C
19L°C
€TLT
989°C
8¥9°C
019°C
TLST
gesT
L6¥C

vSTy
10Ty
8Y1Yy
S60°y
o'y
686°¢
9¢6°¢
€88°¢
0€8°¢
LLL'E
vTL'E
TLYE
619°¢
99¢°¢
€Is’e
09t°¢
LOY'E
goee
T0¢°e
6vCe
961°¢
rri'e
160°¢
8¢0°¢
¢86C
€€6°C
088°C
LT8T
CLLT
TTLT
699°C

Y0v'C
6LET
¢SeT
1€€°C
LOET
78TC
8STT
Y€TT
01TC
S8I1°C
191°C
LETT
€rre
680°C
¥90°C
0v0°C
910°C
766°1
8L6'T
196°1
rr6'l
LT61
1161
768°1
LLST
198°1
rr8°1
LT81
1181
YoL'1
LLLT

Sr9°e
209°¢
86S¢
SISe
ILY'E
8TP'E
v8e'e
R 2%
L6TE
vST'e
11T°¢
L9T°¢
vTre
080°¢
LEOE
¥66°C
0S6°C
LO6°C
¥98°C
028C
LLLT
YELT
069°C
LY9C
¥09°C
196°C
LIST
vLY'T
1€V
88€°C
SPET

vSTy
10Ty
8Y1Yy
S60°y
o'y
686°¢
9¢6°¢
€88°¢
0€8°¢
LLL'E
vTL'E
TLYE
619°¢
99¢°¢
€Is’e
09t°¢
LOY'E
goee
T0¢°e
6vCe
961°¢
rri'e
160°¢
8¢0°¢
¢86C
€€6°C
088'C
LT8T
CLLT
TTLT
699°C

06
68
88
L8
98
¢8
¥8
€8
4]
18
08
6L
8L
LL
9L
SL
VL
€L
CL
IL
0L
69
89
L9
99
<9
79
€9
9
19
09



€299
6959
v15°9
09t°9
90%°9
T6€9
86C°9
vvCT9
6819
Ser9
1809
L20°9
€L6'S
816°S
798°C
018°¢
9GL°S
T0L’S
LY9°S
€6S°S
6€S°S
S8Y's
IEv'S
LLE'S
€Tes
69C°S
SIT’S
191°¢
LOT'S
€50°S
666t

¥06°S
0S8°S
L6L'S
€vL'S
069°S
LEY'S
€86S°C
0€S°S
LLY'S
€r's
0LE'S
LIES
¥9T'¢S
01T°S
LST'S
YO1°S
160°S
L66Y
rr6e'y
168t
8€8Y
S8L'Y
eLY
6L9Y
S99t
LSy
61SY
99ty
cIv'y
09¢'Y
LOEY

S09°L
SIS’L
STY'L
See’L
SYT'L
SSI°L
990°L
9L6%9
9889
96L°9
90L'9
L19°9
LTS9
LEY9
8¢9
85T9
891°9
6L0°9
686°S
668°S
018°¢
0TL'S
1€9°S
17S°S
[4S4S
79¢°S
€LT'S
€81°g
760°S
S00°S
Sl6'y

ILL'E
0€L'E
689°¢
8¥9°¢
L09°¢
99¢6°¢
gTse
r81°€
Evye
or'e
19€°¢
61€°¢
8LT'E
LETE
961°¢
SSIe
14083
€L0°C
T€0°¢
S66C
€L6T
166°C
626°C
906°C
¥88°C
798°C
08T
818C
96L°C
YLL'T
ISLT

LYS'S
98%°C
STr's
¥9¢°S
€0€’S
[A7AS
181°¢
0zI's
650°S
666t
8¢6'Y
LLSY
918t
SSLY
69t
€€9'y
€LSY
(419 %
ISY'y
06€Y
6TcY
89T
LOTY
LYTY
980t
S0y
796°¢
€06°¢
€v8e
T8LE
1TLE

6v

LYS'S
98t°¢S
STr's
¥9€°¢
€0€’s
(474
I81°S
0TI’S
650°S
666
86t
LLSY
918
SSL'Y
r69°y
€e9'y
€LSY
(489 %
ISty
06€t
6CEt
89Ty
LOTY
Ly1'Y
980t
S0y
796°¢
€06°¢
€v8°¢
T8LE
1TLE

86LY
09LY
€LY
S89°t
LY9'y
019
LSy
reSy
96ty
6SYy
1T’y
€8Ey
Sre'y
80¢Y
0LTY
Ty
S6l't
LSTY
6111
180t
vy
900t
896°¢€
0€6°¢
€68°¢
¢e8'¢
L18°¢
08L€
TrL'E
YOL'E
999°¢

¥06°S
0S8°S
L6L'S
€vL'S
069°S
LEY'S
€86°¢S
0€S°S
LLY'S
€Tr's
0LE'S
LIES
¥9T°S
01T°¢
LST'S
YOI°S
1S0°S
L66Y
vre'y
168
8¢Sy
S8LY
LY
6L9t
ST9'y
TLSY
615t
99ty
8%
09¢y
LOEY

8SI°¢
eere
601°¢
¢80°¢
090°¢
9€0°¢
T10°¢
L86C
€96°C
6£6C
v16C
068°C
998°C
1¥8°C
L18C
€6L°C
89LC
YrLT
0CLT
$69°C
1L9°C
LY9C
79T
86S°C
vLST
6¥SC
Y4y
10S°C
LLY'T
[4S4¢
8TP'C

100°S
LS6'Y
€r6y
698t
98t
8Ly
8ELY
v69't
089t
LO9Y
€95y
615t
SLY'Y
v’y
88€Y
rre'y
00€y
LSTY
€Icy
691t
STy
80t
80y
766°¢
1S6°¢
LO6°C
€98°¢
0T8°¢
9LLE
€eL'e
689°¢

706°S
0S8°S
L6L'S
€vL'S
069°S
LE9'S
€86°¢C
0€S°S
LLY'S
€Tr's
0LE'S
LIES
¥9T°S
01T
LST'S
YOI°S
1S0°S
L66Y
vre'y
168
8¢Sy
S8LY
Ly
6L9t
ST9'y
TLSY
615t
99ty
Elvy
09¢'y
LOEY

14!
0cI
611
811
LT1
18!
98!
148!
ell
(48!
ITI1
01T
601
801
LOT
901
S0l
v01
€01
01
101
00T

66

86

L6

96

S6

v6

€6

6

16



08T°8
LTT'8
€LT8
0zI1°8
L90°8
€108
096°L
906°L
€S8°L
008°L
OL'L
€69°L
6€9°L
98S°L
€esL
6LV L
9TY'L
€LEL
61¢°L
99T°L
TIT’L
6ST°L
901°L
TS0°L
6669
$¥6°9
7689
6€8°9
S8L9
1€L°9
LL9'9

SesL
8L
6CYL
LLE'L
vTe'L
TLT'L
61T°L
991°L
PITL
190°L
800°L
9569
€069
168°9
86L°9
SYL9
€699
099
8859
¢ec9
819
0€Y'9
LLE9
¥Te'9
TLT9
6129
L9179
Y119
190°9
6009
956°S

€5€01
§9T°01
9L1°01
L8001
6666
0166
1286
€eL'6
rr9°6
¢ss6
L9Y'6
8LE'6
687°6
10T°6
[ARN0)
€206
¢e6'8
9188
LSL'8
699°8
08$'8
1618
€078
r1€'8
¢TT
LET'8
8108
6S6°L
1L8°L
T8LL
€69°L

620°S
886t
8Y6'Y
LO6Y
L98Y
98y
98LY
SYL'Y
SOLY
799t
ve9'y
78Sy
evs'y
€0S'y
o'y
wr'y
18€Y
827
00€Y
09Tt
61Tt
6L1Y
6€1l'Y
860
850t
L10Y
LL6E
9¢6°¢
S68°¢
€68°¢
T18°¢

LTY'L
99¢°L
S0E’L
SYT'L
v8I°L
vTI'L
€90°L
200°L
6’9
1889
0289
09L°9
6699
8€9°9
8LS9
LIS9
95¥°9
96£9
cee9
vLT9
v1T°9
€519
€60°9
T€0'9
1L6°S
116°S
0S8°S
68L°S
6TL'S
899°¢C
L09°S

0S

LTY'L
99¢°L
SOgL
SYT'L
v8I°L
veI'L
€90°L
200°L
69
1889
0289
09L°9
6699
8¢9°9
8LS9
L1S9
95+'9
96¢°9
gee9
vLT9
v1T°9
€519
€609
€09
1L6°S
116°S
0S8°S
68L°S
6CL’S
899°¢
LO9°S

896°S
0€6°S
768°S
7$8°¢
L18°S
6LL'S
IvL'S
YOL'S
999°¢
879°C
065°S
YIS
SISS
LLY'S
6€Y'S
[{U&S
¥9€°¢
TANS
68T°S
16T°S
€res
SLI'S
8€1°¢C
001°S
790°¢
S20°s
L86Y
66t
116
vLSY
9¢8t

SesL
8YL
6Th'L
LLE'L
YTe'L
TLTL
61T°L
991°L
vIT°L
190°L
800°L
9569
€069
1689
86L°9
SYL9
€699
0v9°9
8859
ges9
879
0’9
LLE9
vTe'9
TLT9
6129
L91°9
vI1'9
1909
6009
956°S

106°¢
LLSE
€68°¢
6C8°¢
S08°¢
I8L°¢
LSLE
€eL'e
60L°€
989°¢
799°¢
8¢9°¢
r19°¢
06S°€¢
996°¢
Ts'e
816°¢
vor'e
0LY'€
9rp'E
e
86€°¢
YLEE
0S¢°€
9ze'e
T0¢g°€¢
8LTE
12943
0€T°€¢
90T'¢
8Ie

6€£9
9679
T8T9
6079
991°9
ANY
0809
LEO9
¥66°S
166°S
806°S
798°C
128°S
8LLS
SeL's
T69°S
619°C
909°S
€96°¢S
0cs's
9LY'S
€er's
06€°S
LYE'S
Y0g’S
192°¢
8IS
SLI'S
I€1°¢
880°S
vr0°S

SesL
8Y°L
6Th'L
LLE'L
YTe'L
TLTL
61T°L
991°L
vIT°L
190°L
800°L
9569
€069
1689
86L°9
SYL9
€699
0v9°9
8859
ges9
7879
0€t'9
LLE9
¥Te'9
TLT9
6129
L91°9
vI1'9
1909
6009
956°S

4!
IST
0SI1
671
871
Lyl
4!
54!
124!
eVl
ol
vl
ovl
6¢1
8¢l
LET
9¢l
Gel
vel
eel
(43!
Il
o€l
6¢Cl
8C1
LTl
9¢1
4!
144!
€Cl
(44!



Se6'6
188°6
878’6
SLL'6
1TL°6
899°6
S19°'6
195°6
80S°6
12940
10t°6
8¥€°6
v67°6
874
881°6
veEL'6
180°6
L20°6
vL6'8
126°8
L98°8
v18°8
09L°8
LOL'8
¥S9°8
009°8
LYS'8
v6v'8
ott'8
LSE8
€ee8

991°6
€rre
090°6
800°6
¢S6'8
€068
058’8
L6L'8
SYL'8
769°8
6€9°8
L8S8
123
878
68
9LE"8
vTe's
1LT'8
61T°8
991°8
€rrg
190°8
800°8
9S6°L
€06°L
0S8°L
86L°L
SYL'L
T69°L
0v9°L
L8S°L

201°€1
€r0°ct
ST6Cl
9€8°CI
LYLT1
659°C1
0LSCT
18¥°C1
€6£T1
Y0€TT
SIeel
LTITI
8€0°CI
6611
198°T1
TLLTT
€89°11
S6S°T1
90S°1T1
LIYTI
6C¢ 11
ovT 11
ISTTT
€90°T1
vL6°01
¢88°01
L6L01
80L°01
61901
1€5°01
ol

€879
9
20T9
791°9
121°9
180°9
009
0009
656°S
616°S
8L8'S
8¢8°S
L6L'S
LSL'S
91IL'S
9L9°G
9€9°¢
S6S°S
YN
v16°¢
YLY'S
€er's
€6¢°S
[4S%S
(AN
1LTS
1€T°S
061°¢
0ST1°S
011°¢
690°S

LOE'6
9T°6
981°6
YAN
¥90°6
¥00°6
€v6°'8
788°8
TT8°8
19L°8
00L'8
0v9°8
6LS°8
8IS°8
8SP'8
L6E']
LEE'S
9LT8
SIT'8
SYR]
7608
€08
€L6'L
Tl6°L
168°L
T6L°L
0€L'L
699°L
609°L
8¥S°L
L8Y'L

S

LOE'6
9’6
981°6
AN
¥90°6
¥00°6
€768
788°8
78’8
19L°8
00L'8
0v9°8
6LS°8
8158
8518
L6E8
LEES
9LT8
SIT8
SS1'8
760°8
€608
€LO'L
T16°L
168°L
16L°L
0€LL
699°L
609°L
8YS'L
L8Y'L

LET'L
660°L
90°L
v20°'L
9869
8169
1169
€L8°9
ce8’9
86L°9
09L°9
TTL9
7899
LY9°9
609°9
1LS°9
¥€S°9
9619
8S+'9
0Tr'9
€8€°9
SYE9
LOE9
6929
T€T9
¥61°9
9619
611°9
180°9
€09
€009

991°6
€Ire
090°6
800°6
SS6'8
€068
058°8
L6L'8
SrL'8
7698
6€9°8
L8S8
veS8
878
6Tr'8
9LE"8
vTe'g
1LT'8
61C°8
991°8
€rrg
190°8
800°8
956°L
€06°L
0S8°L
86L°L
SYL'L
T69°L
0v9°L
L8S°L

v’y
029y
965t
LSy
8YSYy
ves'y
00S‘Yy
LYY
[4S 4%
8TY'y
Yor'y
08¢t
LSEY
€eey
60¢t
S8T'Y
19C°Y
LETY
€Icy
6817
Iy
vy
LITY
€60y
690t
Y0y
120t
L66°€
€L6'C
616°¢€
STo'c

SLY'L
TE9°L
68S°L
9SL
€0S°L
09t°L
LI¥'L
€LEL
0€€’L
L8T'L
YrTL
10T°L
8ST°L
SIT'L
TLO'L
620°L
¢86°9
6’9
6689
9689
€189
0LL9
LTL9
7899
%99
L6S9
¥SS°9
1159
899
STr'9
78¢%9

991°6
€Ire
090°6
800°6
$S6'8
€068
058°8
L6L'S
SrL'8
T69°8
6€9°8
L8S8
veSg
878
6Tr'8
9LE"8
vTe'g
1LT'8
61C°8
991°8
€Irg
190°8
800°8
956°L
€06°L
0S8°L
86L°L
SYL'L
T69°L
0v9°L
L8S°L

€81
[4]!
181
081
6L1
8L1
LLT
OLI
SLI
VLI
€Ll
CLT
ILT
0LT
691
891
L91
991
S
¥91
€91
91
191
091
6S1
861
LST
9¢1
GSl
12!
€Sl



[43

801
68L°01
9¢€L°01
789°01
629°01
SLS 01
zssol
69¥°01
SI¥o1
79¢°01
60£°01
gszol
20T°01
8¥1°01
S60°01
o0l

8866

090°01
L0001
SS6°6
206°6
0S8°6
L6L'6
vrL'6
69°6
6€9°6
L8S°6
12390)
181°6
6216
9LE6
€Te6
1LT6
81C°6

60911
0TSyl
[4547!
erEPI
vSTY1
9911
LLOYT
886°¢CI
006°€1
118°¢€1
€TLET
r€9°€l
SPSel
LSY' €T
89¢°€El
6LTET
161°€1

1L6°9
0€69
0689
6789
6089
89L°9
8TL9
L899
LY9'9
L09°9
9959
92s’9
¢8%°9
SP'9
Y0v'9
¥9€°9
€C€9

8¢€01
LLTO1
L1T01
9G1°01
S60°01
Se0’0l
vL6%6
€16'6
€586
T6L°6
1€L°6
1L9°6
0196
6156
6876
8Tr°'6
89¢€°6

8€€01
LLTO1
L1T°01
961°01
S60°01
Se0'01
vL66
€16'6
€58°6
T6L°6
1€L°6
1L9°6
019°6
656
687°6
8TY'6
89¢°6

89L°L
1€L°L
769°L
LSO°L
029°L
T8S°L
SYS'L
80S°L
ILY'L
vev'L
L6E'L
09¢°L
TeL
S8T’L
8YT'L
11T°L
vLI'L

090°01
L0001
¢S6'6
206°6
058°6
L6L'6
vrL6
269°6
6€9°6
L8S°6
75’6
18%°6
6TY'6
9LE’6
€€6
1LT6
8IC6

160°S
820°S
¥00°S
086t
956'Y
(4504
806t
788t
098t
9¢8t
I8y
88LY
YLV
OvL'Yy
91LY
069y
899

8078
S9¢€8
TTE8
6LT8
9¢T°8
€61°8
0S1°8
901°8
€908
020°8
LL6'L
vE6°L
168°L
8¥8°L
S08°L
T9L°L
8ILL

090°01
L0001
¢S6'6
206°6
058°6
L6L'6
vrL6
269°6
6€9°6
L8S6
12390
18%°6
6TY°6
9LE’6
€€6
1LT6
8IC°6

00¢
661
861
L6l
961
g6l
1!
€61
(4!
161
06l
681
881
L81
981
¢8I
781



“Table of final fees for cracked trials

SCHEDULE 7
Substitution for tables following paragraph 8(2) of Schedule 2 to the

Criminal Remuneration Regulations

Regulation 6(7)(j)

Class of Offence PPE Range Initial Fee (£) Incremental fee per
page of prosecution
evidence (£)

A 501-999 3,985.26 6.07

A 1000-2799 7,013.99 3.55

A 2800-4599 13,399.58 3.55

A 4600-6399 19,785.18 2.82

A 6400-8199 24,854.29 2.82

A 8200-9999 29,923.39 2.82

A 10,000 34,989.69 0

B 501-999 2,745.74 3.31

B 1000-2799 4,398.09 221

B 2800-4599 8,367.99 221

B 4600-6399 12,337.89 1.85

B 6400-8199 15,675.89 1.85

B 8200-9999 19,013.87 1.85

B 10,000 22,350.01 0

C 501-999 1,729.06 2.03

C 1000-2799 2,742.22 1.29

C 2800-4599 5,069.77 1.29

C 4600-6399 7,397.33 1.29

C 6400-8199 9,724.89 1.29

C 8200-9999 12,052.45 1.29

C 10,000 14,378.71 0

D 501-999 3,721.05 5.52

D 1000-2799 6,476.83 3.26

D 2800-4599 12,346.28 3.26

D 4600-6399 18,215.74 2.68

D 6400-8199 23,032.00 2.68

D 8200-9999 27,848.26 2.68

D 10,000 32,661.85 0

E 501-999 1,414.86 1.32

E 1000-2799 2,071.81 0.55

E 2800-4599 3,065.16 0.55

E 4600-6399 4,058.52 0.55

E 6400-8199 5,051.89 0.55

E 8200-9999 6,045.25 0.55

E 10,000 7,038.05 0

F 501-999 1,407.65 1.62

F 1000-2799 2,215.42 0.63

F 2800-4599 3,349.43 0.63

F 4600-6399 4,483.43 0.63

F 6400-8199 5,617.43 0.63

F 8200-9999 6,751.43 0.63

F 10,000 7,884.80 0



G 501-999 1,407.65
G 1000-2799 2,21542
G 2800-4599 3,349.43
G 4600-6399 4,483.43
G 6400-8199 5,617.43
G 8200-9999 6,751.43
G 10,000 7,884.80
H 501-999 1,376.08
H 1000-2799 2,077.83
H 2800-4599 3,210.31
H 4600-6399 4,342.78
H 6400-8199 5,475.25
H 8200-9999 6,607.73
H 10,000 7,7139.57
I 501-999 1,878.27
I 1000-2799 2,922.00
I 2800-4599 4,382.54
I 4600-6399 5,843.07
I 6400-8199 7,303.60
I 8200-9999 8,764.14
I 10,000 10,223.85
J 501-999 3,985.26
J 1000-2799 7,013.99
J 2800-4599 13,399.58
J 4600-6399 19,785.18
J 6400-8199 24,854.29
J 8200-9999 29,923.39
J 10,000 34,989.69
K 501-999 2,607.98
K 1000-2799 4,872.23
K 2800-4599 12,023.79
K 4600-6399 19,175.37
K 6400-8199 25,273.74
K 8200-9999 31,372.12
K 10,000 37,467.10

1.62
0.63
0.63
0.63
0.63
0.63

1.41
0.63
0.63
0.63
0.63
0.63

2.09
0.81
0.81
0.81
0.81
0.81

6.07
3.55
3.55
2.82
2.82
2.82

4.54
397
397
3.39
3.39
3.39

Table of final fees for guilty pleas

Class of Offence PPE Range Initial Fee (£) Incremental fee per
page of prosecution
evidence (£)

A 501-999 2,511.21 2.68

A 1000-2799 3,847.97 1.71

A 2800-4599 6,931.71 1.71

A 4600-6399 10,015.43 1.01

A 6400-8199 11,835.33 1.01

A 8200-9999 13,655.24 1.01

A 10,000 15,474.14 0

B 501-999 2,058.11 2.06

B 1000-2799 3,084.59 1.31

B 2800-4599 5,448.09 1.31

B 4600-6399 7,811.60 0.96

B 6400-8199 9,543.20 0.96

B 8200-9999 11,274.79 0.96

54



R Rl il l i sl slicslias il sl sl o No No NoRo No No e BesBesHeslissHe sl sleslicslicsBesBesHesHes Bvl vl vEvEvEvEvioNoNoNo N Ro Re R

10,000
501-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
501-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
501-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
501-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
501-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
501-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
501-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
501-999
1000-2799
2800-4599

55

13,005.42
1,400.53
2,058.00
3,345.14
4,632.30
5,919.46
7,206.61
8,493.05
2,348.90
3,587.84
6,370.53
9,153.23

10,882.75

12,612.25

14,340.79
1,233.02
1,798.34
2,549.32
3,300.30
4,051.28
4,802.26
5,552.82
1,164.16
1,610.41
2,128.34
2,646.26
3,164.19
3,682.12
4,199.75
1,164.16
1,610.41
2,128.34
2,646.26
3,164.19
3,682.12
4,199.75
1,172.27
1,619.03
2,133.57
2,648.12
3,162.66
3,677.21
4,191.45
1,298.46
1,913.36
2,742.18
3,571.00
4,399.83
5,228.67
6,057.03
2,511.21
3,847.97
6,931.71

1.32
0.72
0.72
0.72
0.72
0.72

2.48
1.55
1.55
0.96
0.96
0.96

1.13
0.42
0.42
0.42
0.42
0.42

0.89
0.29
0.29
0.29
0.29
0.29

0.89
0.29
0.29
0.29
0.29
0.29

0.90
0.29
0.29
0.29
0.29
0.29

1.23
0.46
0.46
0.46
0.46
0.46

2.68
1.71
1.71



J 4600-6399 10,015.43 1.01
J 6400-8199 11,835.33 1.01
J 8200-9999 13,655.24 1.01
J 10,000 15,474.14 0

K 501-999 2,177.77 2.65
K 1000-2799 3,498.21 2.46
K 2800-4599 7,934.06 2.46
K 4600-6399 12,369.90 1.88
K 6400-8199 15,752.56 1.88
K 8200-9999 19,135.22 1.88
K 10,000 22,515.98 0”

SCHEDULE 8 Regulation 6(7)(k)

Substitution for tables following paragraph 9(2) of Schedule 2 to the

“Table of final fees for trials

Criminal Remuneration Regulations

Class of Offence PPE Range Initial Fee (£) Incremental fee per
page of prosecution
evidence (£)

A 501-699 6,605.42 11.44

A 700-1049 8,882.80 9.61

A 1050-1999 12,244.73 8.33

A 2000-3599 20,157.51 7.61

A 3600-5199 32,337.32 7.61

A 5200-6799 44,517.12 7.61

A 6800-8399 56,696.95 7.61

A 8400-9999 68,876.76 7.61

A 10,000 81,048.96 0

B 501-899 5,610.00 8.71

B 900-1299 9,084.69 7.32

B 1300-1999 12,011.13 6.41

B 2000-3299 16,499.55 6.41

B 3300-4999 24,835.21 6.41

B 5000-5999 35,735.68 6.41

B 6000-7999 42,147.72 6.41

B 8000-8999 54,971.80 6.41

B 9000-9999 61,383.84 6.41

B 10,000 67,789.47 0

C 501-799 4,829.62 8.35

C 800-1249 7,324.86 6.98

C 1250-1999 10,467.86 6.18

C 2000-3199 15,099.47 4.27

C 3200-4559 20,223.84 4.27

C 4560-5919 26,031.46 4.27

C 5920-7279 31,839.08 4.27

C 7280-8639 37,646.71 4.27

C 8640-9999 43,454.33 4.27

C 10,000 49,257.70 0

D 501-699 6,275.15 10.87

56



el e e =B ol ol sl olie sl sl ol sl M N O N N No No Mo NaNoNesle: Me-Neolle: le-Neslle:Ne-Neslic:Ne-Neslie:Ne:Nesle: oA vAvEvAvEvEv v

700-1049
1050-1999
2000-3599
3600-5199
5200-6799
6800-8399
8400-9999
10,000
501-599
600-1349
1350-2999
3000-4749
4750-6499
6500-8249
8250-9999
10,000
501-699
700-1399
1400-1949
1950-3549
3550-5149
5150-6749
6750-8349
8350-9999
10,000
501-699
700-1399
1400-1949
1950-3549
3550-5149
5150-6749
6750-8349
8350-9999
10,000
501-619
620-1299
1300-2999
3000-4999
5000-5999
6000-6999
7000-7999
8000-8999
9000-9999
10,000
501-799
800-1299
1300-2699
2700-4199
4200-5359
5360-6519
6520-7679
7680-8839
8840-9999

57

8,438.66
11,632.50
19,149.63
30,720.44
42,291.27
53,862.10
65,432.92
76,996.51

3,823.58

4,565.52

8,256.29
11,819.21
15,598.07
19,376.92
23,155.77
26,932.46

3,219.23

4,472.31

8,015.66
10,164.34
13,282.65
16,400.96
19,519.27
22,637.58
25,851.39

3,219.23

4,472.31

8,015.66
10,164.34
13,282.65
16,400.96
19,519.27
22,637.58
25,851.39

3,577.70

4,346.77

7,611.47
14,089.28
18,199.58
20,254.67
22,309.83
24,364.99
26,420.15
28,473.24

4,126.78

6,584.12
10,649.53
19,617.04
23,746.01
26,939.07
30,132.14
33,325.22
36,518.28

9.13
791
7.23
7.23
7.23
7.23
7.23

1.75
4.92
2.16
2.16
2.16
2.16
2.16

6.30
5.06
391
1.95
1.95
1.95
1.95
1.95

6.30
5.06
391
1.95
1.95
1.95
1.95
1.95

6.46
4.80
3.81
2.06
2.06
2.06
2.06
2.06
2.06

8.22
8.13
6.41
2.75
2.75
2.75
2.75
2.75
2.75



I 10,000 39,708.59 0
] 501-699 6,605.42 11.44
J 700-1049 8,882.80 9.61
J 1050-1999 12,244.73 8.33
J 2000-3599 20,157.51 7.61
] 3600-5199 32,337.32 7.61
J 5200-6799 44,517.12 7.61
] 6800-8399 56,696.95 7.61
J 8400-9999 68.,876.76 7.61
J 10,000 81,048.96 0
K 501-734 3,915.04 7.83
K 735-1289 5,746.58 7.88
K 1290-2399 10,120.31 8.02
K 2400-4499 19,024.76 7.99
K 4500-7999 35,807.93 7.99
K 8000-8399 63,779.87 7.99
K 8400-8799 66,976.65 7.99
K 8800-9199 70,173.44 7.99
K 9200-9599 73,370.24 7.99
K 9600-9999 76,567.04 7.99
K 10,000 79,755.84 0”
SCHEDULE 9 Regulation 6(7)(q)

Substitution for paragraph 21(2) to (6) of Schedule 2 to the Criminal
Remuneration Regulations

“(2) Where the proceedings to which this paragraph applies are discontinued by a notice
served under section 23A of the Prosecution of Offences Act 1985(a) (discontinuance of
proceedings after accused has been sent for trial) at any time before the prosecution serves
its evidence in accordance with the Crime and Disorder Act 1998 (Service of Prosecution
Evidence) Regulations 2005(b) the litigator must be paid the fee specified in the table
following this sub-paragraph, as appropriate to the offence with which the assisted person is

charged.

Discontinuance before evidence served

Class of Offence

Fee payable (£)

ST IEZammoaQwe

307.57
251.40
200.22
292.19
83.50
88.52
88.52
86.33
78.93
307.57

(a) 1985 c. 23. Section 23A was inserted by paragraph 64 of Schedule 8 to the Crime and Disorder Act 1998 (c. 37) and
amended by paragraph 57(7)(b) of Schedule 3 and Part 4 of Schedule 37 to the Criminal Justice Act 2003 (c. 44).

(b) S.1.2005/902. Amended by S.1. 2012/1345.

58



K 289.70

(3) Sub-paragraph (4) applies where—

(a) proceedings to which this paragraph applies are discontinued by a notice served
under section 23A of the Prosecution of Offences Act 1985 at any time after the
prosecution serves its evidence in accordance with the Crime and Disorder Act
1998 (Service of Prosecution Evidence) Regulations 2005;

(b) following a relevant application for dismissal—
(i) the charge, or charges are dismissed and the assisted person is discharged, or

(ii) the case is remitted to the magistrates’ court in accordance with paragraph
10(3)(a), 13(2) or 15(3)(a) of Schedule 3 to the Crime and Disorder Act
1998(a), or

(c) atarelevant hearing—
(i) the prosecution offers no evidence and the assisted person is discharged, or

(ii) the case is remitted to the magistrates’ court in accordance with paragraph
10(3)(a), 13(2) or 15(3)(a) of Schedule 3 to the Crime and Disorder Act 1998.

(4) Where this sub-paragraph applies, the litigator must be paid—

(a) 1in a case in which the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the court
is less than or equal to 500, a fee determined in accordance with paragraph 3AA
for representing an assisted person in a guilty plea, as appropriate to the offence
with which the assisted person is charged and the number of pages of prosecution
evidence served on the court, or

(b) in a case in which the number pages of prosecution evidence served on the court
exceeds 500, a fee calculated in accordance with paragraph 8 for representing an
assisted person in a guilty plea, as appropriate to the offence with which the
assisted person is charged and the number of pages of prosecution evidence served
on the court.

(5) In sub-paragraph (3)—

(a) “relevant application for dismissal” means—

(1) an application under paragraph 2 of Schedule 3 to the Crime and Disorder Act

1998(b) (procedure where persons are sent for trial under section 51:
applications for dismissal);

(ii) section 6 of the Criminal Justice Act 1987(c) (applications for dismissal), or

(iii) paragraph 5 of Schedule 6 to the Criminal Justice Act 1991(d) (notices of
transfer: procedure in lieu of committal: applications for dismissal), and

(b) “relevant hearing” means—

(1) a plea and case management hearing that takes place after the prosecution
serves its evidence, or

(i1) any other hearing that takes place before a plea and case management hearing
has taken place, but after the prosecution has served its evidence.”

(a)
(b)
©
(@

1998 c. 37. Amended by paragraphs 20(10)(a), (b) and (d) and 20(13)(a) and (b) of Schedule 3 and Part 4 of Schedule 37 to
the Criminal Justice Act 2003.

Amended by paragraph 20(3)(a)(i) and (ii) of Schedule 3, paragraph 73 of Part 4 of Schedule 36 and Part 4 of Schedule 37
to the Criminal Justice Act 2003 and S.I. 2004/2035.

1987 c. 38. Repealed by Part 4 of Schedule 37 to the Criminal Justice Act 2003, subject to savings specified in article 5 of
S.1. 2012/1320 and articles 3 and 4 of S.I. 2012/2574 and SI2013/1103.

1991 c. 53. Repealed by Part 4 of Schedule 37 to the Criminal Justice Act 2003, subject to savings specified in article 5 of
S.1. 2012/1320 and articles 3 and 4 of S.I. 2012/2574 and SI2013/1103.

59



SCHEDULE 10 Regulation 6(7)(s)

Substitution for paragraph 23(2) of Schedule 2 to the Criminal

Remuneration Regulations

“(2) Where in a case on indictment the warrant is not executed within three months of the
date on which it was issued, the fee payable to the litigator is—

(a) where the warrant is issued at or before the plea and case management hearing—

(@)

(ii)

in a case in which the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the
court is less than or equal to 500, a fee determined in accordance with
paragraph 3AA for representing an assisted person in a guilty plea, as
appropriate to the offence with which the assisted person is charged and the
number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the court;

in a case in which the number pages of prosecution evidence served on the
court exceeds 500, a fee calculated in accordance with paragraph 8 for
representing an assisted person in a guilty plea, as appropriate to the offence
with which the assisted person is charged and the number of pages of
prosecution evidence served on the court;

(b) where the warrant is issued after the plea and case management hearing but before
the trial—

(@)

(ii)

in a case in which the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the
court is less than or equal to 500, a fee determined in accordance with
paragraph 3AA for representing an assisted person in a cracked trial, as
appropriate to the offence with which the assisted person is charged and the
number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the court;

in a case in which the number pages of prosecution evidence served on the
court exceeds 500, a fee calculated in accordance with paragraph 8 for
representing an assisted person in a cracked trial, as appropriate to the offence
with which the assisted person is charged and the pages of prosecution
evidence served on the court;

(c) where the warrant is issued during the trial, and the trial is aborted as a result—

(@)

(ii)

in a case in which the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the
court is less than or equal to 500, a fee determined in accordance with
paragraph 3AA for representing an assisted person in a trial, as appropriate to
the offence with which the assisted person is charged and the number of pages
of prosecution evidence served on the court;

in a case in which the number pages of prosecution evidence served on the
court exceeds 500, a fee calculated in accordance with paragraph 7 or, where
appropriate, paragraph 9 for representing an assisted person in a trial, as
appropriate to the offence with which the assisted person is charged, the
number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the court and the length of
the trial.

(2A) For the purpose of sub-paragraph 2(c)(ii), the length of the trial is determined as at
the date the warrant is issued.”

60



SCHEDULE 11 Regulation 6(7)(t)

Substitution for paragraph 25 of Schedule 2 to the Criminal

Remuneration Regulations

“Assisted person unfit to plead or stand trial

25.—(1) Where in any case a hearing is held to determine the question of whether the
assisted person is unfit to plead or to stand trial (a “fitness hearing”’)—

(a) if a trial on indictment is held, or continues, at any time thereafter, the length of the
fitness hearing is (where relevant) included in determining the length of the trial
for the calculation of the fee;

(b) if a trial on indictment is not held, or does not continue, by reason of the assisted
person being found unfit to plead or to stand trial, the litigator must be paid—

(1) in a case in which the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the
court is less than or equal to 500 whichever of the following fees the litigator
elects—

(aa)

(bb)

a fee determined in accordance with paragraph 3AA for representing an
assisted person in a trial, as appropriate to the Class of Offence elected
by the litigator under paragraph 3(1)(f) and the number of pages of
prosecution evidence served on the court, or

a fee determined in accordance with paragraph 3AA for representing an
assisted person in a cracked trial, as appropriate to the Class of Offence
elected by the litigator under paragraph 3(1)(f) and the number of pages
of prosecution evidence served on the court;

(i1) in a case in which the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the
court exceeds 500 whichever of the following fees the litigator elects—

(aa)

(bb)

and

a fee calculated in accordance with paragraph 7 or, where appropriate,
paragraph 9 for representing an assisted person in a trial, as appropriate
to the combined length of the relevant hearings, the Class of Offence
elected by the litigator under paragraph 3(1)(f) and the number of pages
of prosecution evidence served on the court, or

a fee calculated in accordance with paragraph 8 for representing an
assisted person in a cracked trial, as appropriate to the Class of Offence
elected by the litigator under paragraph 3(1)(f) and the number of pages
of prosecution evidence served on the court,

(c) if at any time the assisted person pleads guilty to the indictable offence, the
litigator must be paid—

(1) in a case in which the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the
court is less than or equal to 500 whichever of the following fees the litigator
elects—

(aa)

(bb)

a fee determined in accordance with paragraph 3AA for representing an
assisted person in a trial, as appropriate to the Class of Offence elected
by the litigator under paragraph 3(1)(f) and the number of pages of
prosecution evidence served on the court, or

a fee determined in accordance with paragraph 3AA for representing an
assisted person in a guilty plea, as appropriate to the Class of Offence
elected by the litigator under paragraph 3(1)(f) and the number of pages
of prosecution evidence served on the court;

(i1) in a case in which the number of pages of prosecution evidence served on the
court exceeds 500 whichever of the following fees the litigator elects—

61



(aa) a fee calculated in accordance with paragraph 7 or, where appropriate,
paragraph 9 for representing an assisted person in a trial, as appropriate
to the length of the fitness hearing, the Class of Offence elected by the
litigator under paragraph 3(1)(f) and the number of pages of
prosecution evidence served on the court, or

(bb) a fee calculated in accordance with paragraph 8 for representing an
assisted person in a guilty plea, as appropriate to the Class of Offence
elected by the litigator under paragraph 3(1)(f) and the number of pages
of prosecution evidence served on the court.

(2) In sub-paragraph (1)(b)(ii)(aa), “relevant hearings” means—
(a) the fitness hearing, and

(b) any hearing under section 4A of the Criminal Procedure (Insanity) Act 1964(a)
(finding that the accused did the act or made the omission charged against him).”

SCHEDULE 12 Regulation 6(8)(c)(iv)

Substitution for paragraphs 2(4) to (7) of Schedule 4 to the Criminal
Remuneration Regulations
“(4) The table following sub-paragraph (5) sets out—
(a) the Fixed Fees, and
(b) the Escape Fee Case Thresholds,
applicable to Police Station attendance as appropriate to the place of attendance.

(5) For the purposes of sub-paragraphs (3) and (4), where the place of attendance is not a
Police Station, the place of attendance is deemed to be—

(a) where an interviewing Constable is present—

(i) if the interviewing Constable is normally based at a Police Station, that Police
Station, or

(i1) in any other case, the Police Station nearest to the location of the interview, or

(b) where a Services Person is assisting with an investigation by Services Police, the
Police Station nearest to the location of the interview.

Police Station Attendance — Fixed Fees and Escape Fee Case Thresholds

Place of attendance Fixed Fee (£) Escape Fee Case Threshold
€3]
London 200.93 602.79
Outside London 156.19 468.57
(6) The hourly rates for excess travel time are specified in the table following sub-
paragraph (7).

(7) In sub-paragraph (6), “excess travel time” means reasonable travel time in excess of
90 minutes for a one-way journey undertaken for the purpose of Police Station attendance
in accordance with the 2015 Duty Provider Crime Contract.

London Procurement Area Non-London Procurement

(£) Area (£)
Duty Provider 46.37 42.90
Duty Provider (Unsocial 56.97 56.97”

(a) 1964 c. 84. Section 4A was inserted by section 2 of the Criminal Procedure (Insanity and Unfitness to Plead) Act 1991 (c.
25) and amended by section 22(4) and (5) of the Domestic Violence, Crime and Victims Act 2004 (c. 28).

62



Hours)

SCHEDULE 13 Regulation 6(8)(f)(vi)

Substitution for paragraph 5(2) of Schedule 4 to the Criminal
Remuneration Regulations

“(2) The Standard Fees and Standard Fee Limits for representation in a magistrates’ court
are specified in the table following this sub-paragraph.

Representation in a magistrates’ court: Standard Fees and Standard Fee Limits

Standard Fee (£) Standard Fee Limit (£)
Category 1A 235.56 426.61
Category 1B 196.28 426.61
Category 2 449.45 704.88
Category 3 336.01 651.34

(2A) The hourly rate for excess travel time is £21.70.

(2B) In sub-paragraph (2A), “excess travel time” means reasonable travel time in excess
of 90 minutes for a one-way journey undertaken for the purpose of representation in the
magistrates’ court in accordance with the 2015 Duty Provider Crime Contract.”

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

This instrument amends the Criminal Legal Aid (Remuneration) Regulations 2013 (S.I. 2013/435)
(“the Criminal Remuneration Regulations”), which make provision for the remuneration of
criminal legal aid (advice and assistance or representation made available under section 13, 15 or
16 of the Legal Aid Sentencing and Punishment of Offenders Act 2012 (c. 10) (“the Act”)).

Part 2 of and Schedules 1 to 3 to this instrument reduce the fees payable for representation in the
Crown Court to which Schedule 2 to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations applies (litigators’
graduated fee scheme), representation in the Court of Appeal to which Schedule 3 to the Criminal
Remuneration Regulations applies (proceedings in the Court of Appeal) and certain categories of
work to which Schedule 4 to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations applies (advice and
assistance, representation in the magistrates’ court, representation for proceedings relating to an
injunction under Part 1 of the Anti-social Behaviour, Crime and Policing Act 2014 (c. 12) or
prescribed as criminal under section 14(h) of the Act, representation in certain other appeals and
payment for Assigned Counsel). The fees introduced represent a 17.5% reduction from the rates
applicable in April 2013.

Part 3 of and Schedules 4 to 13 to this instrument introduce new fee schemes for representation in
the Crown Court under Schedule 2 to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations and certain advice
and assistance and magistrates’ court representation under Schedule 4 of those regulations.
Regulation 6(7)(c) of and Schedule 5 to this instrument inserts a new Part 1A in Schedule 2 to the
Criminal Remuneration Regulations, introducing fixed fees for guilty pleas, cracked trials and
trials for cases in which the number of pages of prosecution evidence is less than or equal to 500.
Regulation 6(8) of and Schedules 12 and 13 to this instrument amend Schedule 4 to the Criminal
Remuneration Regulations to introduce a new fixed fee structure for Police Station advice and
assistance and standard fee structure for representation in magistrates’ courts.

This instrument also makes amendments to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations, the Criminal
Legal Aid (General) Regulations (S.I. 2013/9), Civil Legal Aid (Remuneration) Regulations 2013
(S.I. 2013/422) and the Criminal Legal Aid (Financial Resources) Regulations (S.I. 2013/471)

63



consequential on the 2015 Duty Provider Crime Contract and Own Client Crime Contract which
replace the 2010 Standard Crime Contract (regulations 4, 5, 6(3) and (8)(b) and 7). The remaining
provisions make consequential amendments or minor clarifications.

The amendments made by Part 2 of this instrument apply to matters in which a determination
under section 13, 15 or 16 of the Act is made on or after 1st July 2015. The amendments made by
Part 3 apply to matters in which a determination under section 13, 15 or 16 is made on or after
11th January 2016.

The contracts referred to in this instrument are available at
https://www.gov.uk/government/publications ?departments%5B %5D=legal-aid-agency. Copies
can be inspected at the Legal Aid Agency (Head Office) at 102 Petty France, London, SW1H 9AJ.

A full impact assessment of the effect that Part 2 of this instrument will have on the costs of
business, the voluntary sector and the public sector is available from the Ministry of Justice, 102
Petty France, London SW1H 9AJ and is published with an Explanatory Memorandum alongside
the instrument on www.legislation.gov.uk. A full impact assessment of the effect that Part 3 of this
instrument will have on the costs of business, the voluntary sector and the public sector was
produced with the Government’s response to the Transforming Legal Aid: Next Steps consultation,
published on 27th February 2014, and is available at https://consult.justice.gov.uk/digital-
communications/transforming-legal-aid-next-steps.

© Crown copyright 2015

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Carol Tullo,
Controller of Her Majesty’s Stationery Office and Queen’s Printer of Acts of Parliament.

UK201506099 06/2015 19585

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2015/1369



