
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2020 No. 1369

The Greenhouse Gas Emissions Trading Scheme
(Withdrawal Agreement) (EU Exit) Regulations 2020

PART 2
Implementation of withdrawal agreement in relation

to electricity generation in Northern Ireland from 2021

Information notices

23. In regulation 69(2)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£1,500” substitute “£5,000”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b)—

(i) for “£150” substitute “£500”,
(ii) for “£13,500” substitute “£45,000”.


