STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2024 No. 240
SOCIAL SECURITY

The Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers” Compensation) (Payment of
Claims) (Amendment) Regulations 2024

Made - - - - 27th February 2024
Coming into force Ist April 2024

The Secretary of State for Work and Pensions makes the following Regulations, in exercise of the
powers conferred by sections 1(1), (2) and (4) and 7(1) and (2) of the Pneumoconiosis etc.
(Workers’ Compensation) Act 1979(a).

In accordance with section 7(3)(b) of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act
1979, a draft of this instrument was laid before, and approved by a resolution of, each House of
Parliament.

Citation, commencement, application and extent
1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation)
(Payment of Claims) (Amendment) Regulations 2024 and come into force on 1st April 2024.

(2) These Regulations apply only in relation to any case in which a person first fulfils the
conditions of entitlement to a payment under the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation)
Act 1979 on or after 1st April 2024.

(3) These Regulations extend to England and Wales and Scotland.

Amendment of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims)
Regulations 1988

2.—(1) The Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims) Regulations
1988(c) are amended as follows.

(2) In the proviso to regulation 5(1) (payment where death results from diffuse mesothelioma)
for “£3,771” substitute “£4,024”.

(3) In regulation 6(1)(a) (payment where pneumoconiosis is accompanied by tuberculosis) for
“£7,801” (in both places) substitute “£8,324”.

(4) In regulation 8 (minimum amount payable to dependant) for “£3,771” substitute “£4,024”.
(5) In the Schedule—
(a) in the part headed “TABLE 17, for the table substitute—

(a) 1979 c. 41. Section 1 was amended by section 24 of the Social Security Act 1985 (c. 53).
(b) Section 7(3) was amended by section 58 of the Welfare Reform Act 2007 (c. 5).
(c) S.I. 1988/668; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1989/552, S.I. 2013/690, S.1. 2015/503 and S.I. 2023/372.



206°Ly G89°Cy LYTEY 08S°0¥ 00L°LE Y65 v¢ 66v°LT 181°CC 981°91 160°6 19
0L9°¢S €SHIS 890°61 60591 66L°cY S9E0r 997°CE CEE9T GIS'81 0ST°01 09
8TV 6S SIT'LS 988°%C Saads S68°61 AN 4 LEO'LE 161°0¢ S8°0C 861°T1 65
L61°G9 086°C9 CIL09 08¢°8S L66°SS 168°1S L6L' ¥ 9S9°v€ 9LT'€T 0STCI 8¢
096°0L 1SL°89 €699 01¢Y9 S60°T9 699°LS 6959t 118°8¢ 00S°ST 80¢°€l LS
LLT'EL 096°0L 1SL°89 7€599 0TEv9 12€°09 9L9°61 8SETY vLT8T 414! 9¢
90¥°SL LLT'EL 096°0L 1SL89 v€599 6L6C9 6LLTS 016°SY ISO°T€ 97S91 Y
619°LL 90¥‘SL LLTEL 096°0L 1SL°89 1¥9°69 €68°GS 0S°'61 Tsee 8CI'8I 123
€E8°6L 619°LL 90¥°SL LLT'EL 096°0L 20€°89 066°8S 666°CS 965°9¢ ceL'6l €S
870°C8 €€8°6L 619°LL 90¥°SL LLI'EL 096°0L €60°79 056°9¢ 79¢°6€ YreEIT [4Y
791°68 w6T8 61,08 97S ‘8L 68T9L €T9°cL 1¥9°69 LL8'8S 91601 790°€T IS
79T°88 17098 LT8°E8 €19°18 68€°6L 68C9L €61°69 °STI9 69Y° T T8LYT 0S
€LE'T6 TS1°68 €€6°98 €ILY8 v6vC8 €S6'8L OvLTL 8€6°€9 120°vP 105°9C (Y4
9LV v6 0STT6 6£0°06 TT8L8 865°C8 €19°18 68C9L 898°G9 €LS Sy 0TT'8T 81
GLS'L6 6S€°S6 S AN 61606 11.°88 YLTV8 €€8°6L 061°89 STI'LY 1¥6°6C Ly
789°86 19%°96 °STY6 ¥€0°CT6 61868 LT8'S8 €19°18 €EI'IL 010°1S CE6IE 9%
¥6L°66 CLS'L6 6S£°S6 SANY 61606 6LEL8 ¥8¢°€8 L90 VL 9881S 1€6°¢E 9%
668°001 789°86 19¥°96 °STY6 ¥€0°CT6 67688 791°68 T00°LL 99L°8S T6°SE 144
S10201 v6L°66 CLS'L6 6S€°S6 [SANY ¥81°06 £€6'98 9v6°6L S¥9°T9 €T6°LE 13917
0TI°€01 668°001 789°86 19%°96 °STY6 ¥€0°C6 T1L°88 788°C8 ¥€599 606°6€ (4%
LEE'SOT 0TI°€01 668001 78986 19¥°96 °STY6 920°16 LT8°C8 95869 8V 1¥ 184
8GG°L01T LEE'SOT 0TI°€01 668°001 789°86 19¥°96 09¢°€6 19L°88 LLT'EL 18STy oy
YLL'601 9GS LOT LEE'SOT 0TI°€01 019°001 889°86 76956 66916 LOS‘9L LO6 EY 6¢
686°T11 YLL60T 96S°L01 LEE'SOT 0TI°€01 668001 ¥20°86 9¢9'v6 €€8°6L 8ETCY 8¢
OIT¥IT 686111 vLL 601 9GS LOT LEE'SOT 0TI°€01 0S€°001 CLS'L6 991°¢8 69591 | Iopun.lio /¢

F F F F F F F F F F

%001 - %06~ %08~ WOL~ %09- %OS- %Ot~ WOE- WOC- 4opun 40
BI6 WIS WBIL W19 WIS BIY WIE BIT BIT WOl uosiad
pa1qosip
poriad juvaajad ayj 40f JudUISSISSD ISDIUIILIJ Jo a3y,




WSYLLY 0v6°S1 6691 168°C1 L8OTT 08°6 129°L S6L°9 945 14\h% 19A0 10 [/,
96€°81 88791 9€1°61 0LT*€1 69¢°11 £00°01 68L°L 1069 T89°¢ 0T’y 9L
LS6°81 610°LI 6LS°ST vrrel €V9°Il IL1°01 956°L 910°L ILLS YTy SL
96561 TO9°LI 92091 YTL€El 81611 €re0l1 STIg €CrL 9L8°S [4S%% YL
181°0¢ 6S1°81 69Y°91 0001 661°CI Y0501 06T°8 9€T'L 066°S 8ty €L
S6L°0C 80L'81 60691 ELTYI LLYTI €L9°01 958 9re’L 860°9 SLSY L
€IS 1T 60761 0cS'L1 €L6VI ¥80°€1 SITTT 968°8 1S9°L 8I€9 vILY IL
Y€TTT 960°0C 8TI8I 999°G1 689°¢€1 T95°11 €vE'6 956°L LYS9 168t 0L
LY6°TT S6L°0C 8€L'81 09€°91 SoEpI L0OOCT S8L'6 ¢9T'8 S9L9 1667 69
TLY€T 18%°1C 0S€'61 610°LI 16yl 0St'C1 veT01 69¢'8 6L69 YANY 89
S6EYC 181°CC LS6°61 SYLLT 8CSSI 168°C1 €L9°01 L98°8 80T°L 0LT'S L9
€Y6°LT STL'ST 81 €T €TIIe 8¢L'8I 08091 ¥80°€1 00L°01 0S8 gT8’S 99
€6vIE SLT'6C LY6°9C 90S+C ¥S6°1¢C 0LT'61 00S°S1 6CSTI 1L8°6 LLE9 S9
Se0'se LI8TE 8EY°0€ 068°LT TLI'ST 1S¥°CC S06°L1 09€v1 861°T1 €69 9
885°8¢ 89€°9¢ 1€6°€€ L9TTE 18€°8C Sy9°ST TTE0T 981°91 6TSTI 981°L €9
LETTY 606°6¢ LTY'LE 959°v¢ 109°1€ 0£8°8¢ 8TLTT 810°81 098°¢€1 8€0°8 9




(b) in the part headed “TABLE 2”, for the table (together with the headings to the table)

substitute—

“Part A
Age of Percentage assessment for the relevant period
disabled
person on 10% 11%-20% 21%-30% 31%-49% 50% or over
their last or under £ £ £ £ £
birthday
before their
death
37 or under 29,496 50,292 56,388 58,053 59,436
38 28,831 48,404 54,722 56,388 58,159
39 28,169 46,519 53,060 54,721 56,884
40 27,498 44,629 51,395 53,060 55,609
41 26,833 42,747 49,733 51,395 54,334
42 26,174 40,869 48,067 49,733 53,060
43 24,973 38,428 46,570 48,234 51,839
44 23,784 35,979 45,070 46,739 50,608
45 22,593 33,543 43,574 45,241 49,396
46 21,400 31,101 41,950 43,744 48,177
47 20,208 28,663 40,589 42,252 46,960
48 19,297 27,996 39,479 41,086 45,464
49 18,375 27,329 38,367 39,921 43,963
50 17,464 26,663 37,262 38,749 42,468
51 16,551 26,000 36,152 37,593 40,976
52 15,636 25,338 35,042 36,427 39,479
53 15,216 23,784 32,938 34,817 38,253
54 14,802 22,230 30,826 33,210 37,038
55 14,388 20,677 28,719 31,605 35,818
56 13,973 19,126 26,611 29,999 34,590
57 13,308 17,578 24,506 28,389 33,374
58 12,250 16,463 22,099 25,564 29,999
59 11,198 15,353 19,687 22,730 26,611
60 10,150 14,253 17,269 19,904 23,233
61 9,091 13,139 14,861 17,077 19,850
62 8,038 12,036 12,445 14,253 16,463
63 7,486 11,949 12,284 13,717 15,497
64 6,943 11,198 12,110 13,195 14,538
65 6,377 9,871 11,949 12,666 13,554
66 5,825 8,540 10,700 12,142 12,586
67 or over 4,024 5,543 6,795 7,621 9,840

Part B

Age of disabled person on their last birthday | Payment £
before their death

37 or under 59,436
38 58,159
39 56,884
40 55,609




41 54,334
42 53,060
43 51,839
44 50,608
45 49,396
46 48,177
47 46,960
48 45,464
49 43,963
50 42,468
51 40,976
52 39,479
53 38,253
54 37,038
55 35,818
56 34,590
57 33,374
58 29,999
59 26,611
60 23,233
61 19,850
62 16,463
63 15,497
64 14,538
65 13,554
66 12,586
67 or over 9,840”.

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Work and Pensions

Mims Davies
Parliamentary Under Secretary of State
27th February 2024 Department for Work and Pensions

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

Under the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act 1979 (c. 41) (“the Act”) lump sum
payments may be made to certain persons disabled by a disease to which the Act applies, or to
dependants of persons who were so disabled before they died.

These Regulations amend the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims)
Regulations 1988 (S.I. 1988/668) (“the 1988 Regulations”). The amendments made by regulation
2 have the effect of increasing the amounts payable under the 1988 Regulations. The increase in
each case is 6.7 per cent rounded up or down to the nearest £1 as appropriate.

By virtue of regulation 1(2), the amendments made by these Regulations apply only in relation to
any case in which a person first fulfils the conditions of entitlement to a payment under the Act on
or after 1st April 2024.

A full impact assessment has not been produced for this instrument as no, or no significant, impact
on the private, voluntary or public sector is foreseen.




© Crown copyright 2024

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Jeff James,
Controller of His Majesty’s Stationery Office and King’s Printer of Acts of Parliament.






ISBN 978-0-34-825817-2

£8.14
http://www .legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2024/240

9"780348"258172




