Police, Crime, Sentencing and Courts Act 2022 (c. 32) 1
SCHEDULE 4 — Pre-charge bail
Document Generated: 2024-05-13
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Police,
Crime, Sentencing and Courts Act 2022, Paragraph 31. (See end of Document for details)

SCHEDULES

SCHEDULE 4

PRE-CHARGE BAIL

PART 4

LIMITS ON PERIOD OF BAIL WITHOUT CHARGE

31 (1) Section 47ZF (applicable bail period: first extension of limit by court) is amended
as follows.

(2) In subsection (1)—
(a) omit paragraph (a),
(b) in paragraph (b), for “section 47ZD” substitute “section 47ZDA”,
(c) after paragraph (b) (but before the “or” at the end of that paragraph) insert—

“(ba) an appropriate decision-maker has authorised an extension
of the applicable bail period in relation to the person under
section 47ZDB,”, and

(d) in paragraph (c), for “an appropriate decision-maker” substitute ‘“a
qualifying police officer”.

(3) In subsection (4)—
(a) in paragraph (a)—
(1) for “subsection (1)(a) or (b)” substitute “subsection (1)(b)”, and
(i) for “6 months” substitute “12 months”, and
(b) in paragraph (b)—
(1) for “subsection (1)(c)” substitute “subsection (1)(ba) or (c)”, and
(i) for “9 months” substitute “18 months”.

(4) In subsection (6)—
(a) in paragraph (a)—
(i) for “subsection (1)(a) or (b)” substitute “subsection (1)(b)”, and
(i1) for “9 months” substitute “18 months”, and
(b) in paragraph (b)—
(i) for “subsection (1)(c)” substitute “subsection (1)(ba) or (¢)”, and
(i1) for “12 months” substitute “24 months”.

(5) In subsection (8), after paragraph (b) insert—
“(ba) an officer of Revenue and Customs,
(bb) a National Crime Agency officer,”.



Police, Crime, Sentencing and Courts Act 2022 (c. 32)
SCHEDULE 4 — Pre-charge bail
Document Generated: 2024-05-13

Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Police,
Crime, Sentencing and Courts Act 2022, Paragraph 31. (See end of Document for details)

Commencement Information
I Sch. 4 para. 31 not in force at Royal Assent, see s. 208(1)
12 Sch. 4 para. 31 in force at 28.10.2022 by S.I. 2022/1075, reg. 4(b)


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2022/32/section/208/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2022/32/schedule/4/paragraph/31
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2022/1075
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2022/1075/regulation/4/b

Police, Crime, Sentencing and Courts Act 2022 (c. 32)
Document Generated: 2024-05-13

Changes to legislation:
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Police, Crime, Sentencing and Courts
Act 2022, Paragraph 31.




